Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: jtansl@gmail.com

Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 12:24 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; 'Tee, Chee-Wah'; zuhri@tanchong.com

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLT 1438S & GBE 5527P ALONG/AT CARPARK BUKIT BATOK

ST31 ON 15/03/2021

Noted.

This is how dangerous it gets when a vehicle suddenly stops: Vehicle flips over along Jurong West Ave after trying to
avoid parked bus, nearly hits jaywalker (msn.com)

Since | do not have the video evidence (overwritten already), there is no evidence | can produce at point; but | seriously
doubt the injury portion as the lorry driver was still walking around taking pictures and he is sensible enough to ask me
for my driver licence and able to bring up his phone to take picture while holding my driver licence in his hands not
shaking.

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 March 2021 10:19 AM

To: JTANSL@GMAIL.COM

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLT 1438S & GBE 5527P ALONG/AT CARPARK BUKIT BATOK ST31 ON 15/03/2021

Our Ref: CC6/AIG21003562/rs3

JEFFREY TAN SOON LEE(JEFFREY CHEN SHUNLI) - BY EMAIL ONLY
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLT 1438S & GBE 5527P ALONG/AT CARPARK BUKIT BATOK ST31 ON 15/03/2021

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from GBE 5527P against your motor insurance policy.

Both parties involved have given conflict of version. Based on the circumstances of accident and both parties damage
profile, there is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either's parties version. Pursuant to the above said accident
wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given us your version of how the
accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable
settlement with third party claimant.

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in
writing within the next 7 daysi.e.by 30/03 /2021 after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant
on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver
against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.



Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it
will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

c.C. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



