Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 3 May 2021 11:11 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: TP / 8163358499SG - FBF7772D / OIV: SKJ 3607Y / DOA: 20/12/2020
Dear Cecilia,

Please proceed to reject third party claim.

Thank you

Norsiah MdNoor
Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10

Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1606
Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com | www.AlG.sg

If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, | do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 15, 2021 10:31 AM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: YOUR REF: TP / 8163358499SG - FBF7772D / OIV: SKJ 3607Y / DOA: 20/12/2020

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

2ND REMINDER

Dear Norsiah,
We refer to the above matter.

We are in the opinion that OID travelling within own lane, TPD travelling on the left hand lane(lane for
straight or left turn only) making a right turn, therefore collided onto OIV.

In view of above, kindly let us have your instruction/approval to reject TP claim.

Thanks

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.



Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 67494274 | email: CeciliaChong@[kKauto.com | fax; 67414108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 April 2021 5:20 PM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Subject: YOUR REF: TP / 8163358499SG - FBF7772D / OIV: SKJ 3607Y / DOA: 20/12/2020

Dear Norsiah,
We refer to the above matter.

We are in the opinion that OID travelling within own lane, TPD travelling on the left hand lane(lane for
straight or left turn only) making a right turn, therefore collided onto OIV.

In view of above, kindly let us have your instruction/approval to reject TP claim.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 67494274 | email: CeciliaChong @lKKauto.com| fax; 67414108
BIK 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)




Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 5 May 2021 10:06 AM

To: ‘erofia@singnet.com.sg’

Subject: YOUR REF: FBF 7772D (OUR REF: CC4/AIG21003478/Uga3) *** ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SKJ 3607Y & FBF 7772D ON 20/12/2020 ***

Attachments: Ol VF.mp4

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Below is a copy of Our Insured report and video for your easy reference. Based on the video footage, our
insured traveling on first lane which is the drive straight or right turn only lane and your client is traveling
on the second lane which is the drive straight or left turn on lane. However, your client make a right turn on
a left turn or straight only lane. Thus, collided onto our insured vehicle



In view of above, we have our principal’s instruction to deny liability and not able to look into this matter.

Thanks

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 67494274 | email: CeciliaChong@[kKauto.com | fax; 67414108

BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

1

#

LI

F
-

Himg

Hiw
\

Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

2






