Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 March 2021 2:03 PM

To: Doris

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: GBH 5885P front windscreen glass
Attachments: GBH5885P EST 1.pdf

Dear Doris,

Please proceed the front windscreen. Attached estimate with our surveyor latest marking.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Doris <doris@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 March 2021 10:04 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBH 5885P front windscreen glass

Dear Shiau Chan
Forward vehicle no : GBH 5885 P Addendum from you record. Please check
Thank

Doris

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 18 March 2021 9:52 AM

To: Doris

Subject: RE: GBH 5885P GIA REPORT

Dear Doris,

Follow our surveyor’s marking estimate or you can check with our surveyor, Kenneth.
As insurance officer did not mention about this to us.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Doris <doris@sh-motor.com>
Sent: Thursday, 18 March 2021 9:34 AM




To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBH 5885P GIA REPORT

Dear Shiau Chan
Noted..Thank..but how about the front windscreen glass ?
Thank

Doris

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 18 March 2021 9:21 AM

To: Doris

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: GBH 5885P GIA REPORT

Dear Doris,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle GBH 5885P at repair cost on Lump

Sum basis (Excess $1,000/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434

to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before

completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Note: Kindly arrange our surveyor to conduct resurvey & before paint for all panels and parts.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Doris <doris@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 March 2021 5:12 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBH 5885P GIA REPORT

Dear Shiau Chan
Forward for you record.
Thank

Doris

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 17 March 2021 5:07 PM




To: Doris
Subject: GBH 5885P GIA REPORT

Dear Doris,

Kindly provide us the GIA report of above vehicle.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



