Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 April 2021 5:19 PM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah

Subject: FW: Accident involving GBF1710Y and SH8229M on 16 Mar 2021

AIG Ref: 9598077105SG
Hi Norsiah,
We refer to the above matter and email below from insured for your reference.

Our insured would like to know the final amount for PD & BI(if any) as they may consider private settlement to
protect NCD.

We will update insured on final claim amount for PD once it is ready.

Kindly assist to advise on the final claim amount for Bl as well. Thanks.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Peter Goh <peter.goh@shoppingbag.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 1 April 2021 2:55 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Elizabeth Moorthy <elizabeth.moorthy@mthai.com.sg>

Subject: Accident involving GBF1710Y and SH8229M on 16 Mar 2021

Hi Ms Chew,

As spoken on the phone, we shall wait for the repair cost and the medical claim amount then we will
discuss how we should settle this matter.

Best Regards,

Peter Goh

Warehouse Manager
Supply Chain & Logistics

DID: +65 6265 7665
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