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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 June 2021 4:07 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject:
转发: Finalize: SKR4090M DOA: 12.03.21

     

发件人

发件人发件人

发件人: Accord Auto(Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg> 

已发送

已发送已发送

已发送: 2021年 6月 17日 16:06:32 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 

收件人

收件人收件人

收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 

主题

主题主题

主题: Re: Finalize: SKR4090M DOA: 12.03.21 

Dear Guo Qiang 
 
Finalize COR $2916.18 before GST @ 4 days.   
 
Thank you. 
 
Kind regards, 
Jacqueline  
Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd 
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A 
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point  
Singapore 568047 
 
Mobile : (65) 9740 0999 
Tel      : (65) 6481 9517 
Fax     : (65) 6481 9516 

 
This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, use or 
copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you. 

 

 

On Thu, 17 Jun 2021 at 15:58, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Jacqueline,  

Attached. 

  

Regards, 

Guo Qiang 
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From: Accord Auto(Claims) [mailto:claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 17 June, 2021 3:48 PM 
To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Re: Finalize: SKR4090M DOA: 12.03.21 

  

Hi Gua Qiang,  

  

Should be $2957.78 / 4day  

  

 
Thank you. 

 
Kind regards, 
Jacqueline / Wai Ping     
Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd 
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A 
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point  
Singapore 568047 

 
Mobile : (65) 9740 0999 
Tel      : (65) 6481 9517 
Fax     : (65) 6481 9516 

  

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, use 
or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you. 

  

  

On Thu, 17 Jun 2021 at 15:39, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Jacqueline, 

  

Finalize COR $2916.18 before GST @ 4 days.   

  

Regards, 
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Guo Qiang 

  

  

From: Accord Auto(Claims) [mailto:claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg]  
Sent: Thursday, 17 June, 2021 3:06 PM 

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Re: Finalize: SKR4090M DOA: 12.03.21 

  

Hi Guo Qiang,  

  

We confirm acceptance P/P: $2957.78 / 4 day  

 
Thank you. 

 
Kind regards, 
Jacqueline  
Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd 
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A 
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point  
Singapore 568047 

 
Mobile : (65) 9740 0999 
Tel      : (65) 6481 9517 
Fax     : (65) 6481 9516 

  

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, use 
or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you. 

  

  

On Wed, 16 Jun 2021 at 16:29, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Jacqueline, 

  

Finalize COR $2957.78 before GST @ 4 days.   

  



4

Regards, 

Guo Qiang 

  

  

From: Accord Auto(Claims) [mailto:claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 16 June, 2021 2:13 PM 
To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Re: Finalize: SKR4090M DOA: 12.03.21 

  

Hi Guo Qiang,  

  

Any update on this? 

 
Thank you. 

 
Kind regards, 
Jacqueline  
Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd 
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A 
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point  
Singapore 568047 

 
Mobile : (65) 9740 0999 
Tel      : (65) 6481 9517 
Fax     : (65) 6481 9516 

  

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, use 
or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you. 

  

  

On Wed, 14 Apr 2021 at 10:26, Accord Auto(Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg> wrote: 

Hi Gou Qiang,  

  

Any update on this? 
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Thank you. 

 
Kind regards, 
Jacqueline  
Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd 
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A 
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point  
Singapore 568047 

 
Mobile : (65) 9740 0999 
Tel      : (65) 6481 9517 
Fax     : (65) 6481 9516 

  

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, 
use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you. 

  

  

On Wed, 7 Apr 2021 at 11:15, Accord Auto(Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Guo Qiang,  

  

  

Encl herewith the after paint photo for your reference.  

  

Please finalize the cost of repair asap. 

 
Thank you. 

 
Kind regards, 
Jacqueline   
Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd 
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A 
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point  
Singapore 568047 

 
Mobile : (65) 9740 0999 
Tel      : (65) 6481 9517 
Fax     : (65) 6481 9516 
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This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, 
use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you. 

  

  

On Tue, 6 Apr 2021 at 13:40, Accord Auto(Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Guo Qiang,  

  

  

Encl herewith the after paint photo for your reference.  

Please finalize the cost of repair asap. 

 
Thank you. 

 
Kind regards, 
Jacqueline / Wai Ping     
Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd 
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A 
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point  
Singapore 568047 

 
Mobile : (65) 9740 0999 
Tel      : (65) 6481 9517 
Fax     : (65) 6481 9516 

  

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, 
use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank 
you. 


