Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 April 2021 1:36 PM
To: Xin Yun Auto

Subject: RE: ESTIMATE SMY 2353H

Hi,

Ok confirm lump sum $7400

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Xin Yun Auto <xinyunautol@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 7 April 2021 1:25 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: ESTIMATE SMY 2353H

Dear Denise,
Good afternoon, we talked to Marcus on this matter, we will keep his marking $7401.27. thank you.

Best Regards,

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto

Tel/Fax:6634 0858

Mobile: 9839 1555
Email:xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Wed, Apr 7, 2021 at 12:18 PM Xin Yun Auto <xinyunautol@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Denise,

Thanks for answering my call, as spoken, there was typo error on the submission, please refer to the attachment for
you and Marcs's consideration.

Thank you for your help,
Best Regards,
Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto



Tel/Fax:6634 0858
Mobile: 9839 1555
Email:xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Wed, Apr 7, 2021 at 9:40 AM Xin Yun Auto <xinyunautol@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Denise,
Good morning, once Marcus finalized the amount, please send me a copy. Thanks alot.

Best Regards,

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto

Tel/Fax:6634 0858

Mobile: 9839 1555
Email:xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Tue, Mar 30, 2021 at 1:46 PM Xin Yun Auto <xinyunautol@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Denise, fyi...thanks.

Best Regards,

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto

Tel/Fax:6634 0858

Mobile: 9839 1555
Email:xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Tue, Mar 30, 2021 at 1:40 PM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Yi Xin,

Marcus asked about the ceramic coating, how? Cancel.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Xin Yun Auto <xinyunautol@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 30 March 2021 12:59 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: ESTIMATE SMY 2353H

Dear Denise,

Good afternoon, today we released the vehicle to client, once Marcus finalized the amount, please send me a copy.
Thanks alot.

Thank you so much for your help,
Best Regards,

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto

Tel/Fax:6634 0858

Mobile: 9839 1555

Email:xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Tue, Mar 23, 2021 at 10:02 AM Xin Yun Auto <xinyunautol@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Denise, thanks alot, well received.

Best Regards,
Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto



Tel/Fax:6634 0858

Mobile: 9839 1555

Email:xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Tue, Mar 23, 2021 at 9:38 AM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

Enclosed estimate marking

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



