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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 31 May 2021 11:28 AM
To: Kon Yin Siew
Cc: William Oh Soon Lee; Ramesh; Admin A
Subject: RE: LOD - Accident Involving SMC1785S and SJK8661M along Ang Mo Kio Ave 5 on 

13/03/2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21003384/Kpa3
Attachments: DV_SMC1785S.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
We confirm settlement at $2,401.28(all-in) as per your LOD. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 28 April 2021 10:06 AM 
To: Kon Yin Siew <KonYinSiew@goldbell.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: William Oh Soon Lee <WilliamOhSL@goldbell.com.sg>; Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LOD - Accident Involving SMC1785S and SJK8661M along Ang Mo Kio Ave 5 on 13/03/2021 *** LKK REF: 
CC4/AIG21003384/Kpa3 
 
Dear Ms. Kon,  
 
We acknowledge receipt of your LOD. 
 
OIC – Hsiao Tong. 
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Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Kon Yin Siew <KonYinSiew@goldbell.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 27 April, 2021 6:33 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: William Oh Soon Lee <WilliamOhSL@goldbell.com.sg>; Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg> 
Subject: LOD - Accident Involving SMC1785S and SJK8661M along Ang Mo Kio Ave 5 on 13/03/2021 
 
Hi Sir / Mdm, 
 
Enclosed herewith the scan copy of our letter of demand and supporting document for your perusal. 
 
Kindly look into the matter and revert the claim settlement to us. 
 
Thank you. 
 
NOTICE: 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to 
be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  
All correspondence should be made via email instead. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

Kon Yin Siew | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 
Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 

DID: +65 6861 0007 | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax: +65 6863 0425 |
Mobile: +65 9739 6433 |  

   

 
 


