Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 19 March 2021 10:53 AM

To: 'Ivy Ratilla’; SUR

Cc: ‘Stanley Lai'; 'Derrick Quok'; 'Kenneth Lim'

Subject: RE: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10009424/ST || OI-SLS477R (White) TP-SML271S || Est:
$1,611.84 || Autolution Industrial

Attachments: SML271S 1A.pdf

Dear lvy,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SML 271S.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 5:17 PM

To: 'lvy Ratilla' <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Stanley Lai' <stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg>; 'Derrick Quok' <derrick.g@budgetdirect.com.sg>; 'Kenneth Lim
<kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10009424/ST | | OI-SLS477R (White) TP-SML271S || Est: $1,611.84 | |
Autolution Industrial

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS
G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

From: lvy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 4:24 PM

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>; 'assignments'

<assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Stanley Lai <stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok <derrick.g@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim
1




