Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 31 May 2021 12:29 PM

To: sales@vtecauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: [Request for LOD & Docs] - Your Ref: SMX3369L // LKK Ref:

CC4/AIG21003371/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFK 7071U(AIG) AND SMX 3369L
ON 10/03/2021]
Attachments: DV_SMX3369L.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for acceptance.

Please duly sign the DV enclosed return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially

affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | S(408933)

————— Original Message-----

From: sales@vtecauto.com.sg <sales@vtecauto.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 29 May 2021 11:04 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [Request for LOD & Docs] - Your Ref: SMX3369L // LKK Ref: CC4/A1G21003371/Upa3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SFK 7071U(AIG) AND SMX 3369L ON 10/03/2021]

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Good day to you!

Yes, we accepted the global sum at $9,000.00(all-in) as the final settlement.

| will proceed to send you the necessary documents.

Thank you for your help!

Stay safe!



Thanks & Regards,

Jolin

V-Tec Asia Automotive Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #07-08/09
Premier@KB Singapore 415875
Tel :6635 2706

HP :8777 1911

Fax :63416232

Email: sales@vtecauto.com.sg
Website: www.vtecauto.com.sg

On 2021-05-28 17:34, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:
> Without Prejudice
>

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

>
>
>
>
> We propose settlement at a global sum of $9,000.00(all-in).
>
> Please confirm acceptance.

>

\"

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is

> purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

> resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal

> proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

> inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

>

> In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently

> produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

> issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by

> the negotiation terms/settlement.”

>

> Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should
> be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in

> softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

>

> —_——

>

> Best Regards,

> Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 Blk 51,

> Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

>
>
>
> From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

> Sent: Tuesday, 11 May 2021 2:46 PM

> To: sales@vtecauto.com.sg <sales@vtecauto.com.sg>

> Subject: RE: [Request for LOD & Docs] - Your Ref: SMX3369L // LKK Ref:

> CC4/AIG21003371/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFK 7071U(AIG) AND SMX 3369L

2




> ON 10/03/2021]

>

> Without Prejudice

>

> Dear Sirs/Mdm,

>

> We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 11/05/2021.

>

> We will look into the matter and get back to you.

>

> “Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is

> purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

> resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal

> proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
> inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

>

> In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced
> by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of

> liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the

> negotiation terms/settlement.”

>

> Best Regards,

> Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 HQ : Blk
> 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

> S(408933)

>

> From: sales@vtecauto.com.sg <sales@vtecauto.com.sg>

> Sent: Tuesday, 11 May 2021 2:06 PM

> To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

> Subject: Re: [Request for LOD & Docs] - Your Ref: SMX3369L // LKK Ref:
> CC4/A1G21003371/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFK 7071U(AIG) AND SMX 3369L
> ON 10/03/2021]

>

> Dear Hsiao Tong,

>

> Good day to you! Hope you are safe and well!

>

> Thank you for your help!

>

> Please find the attached file for the documents of vehicle SMX3369L.
>

> Kindly help to proceed with the necessary.

>

> Stay safe and well! Thank you!

>

> -

> Thanks & Regards,

>

> Jolin

> V-Tec Asia Automotive Pte Ltd

> 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #07-08/09

> Premier@KB Singapore 415875

>Tel :66352706



>HP :8777 1911

>Fax :63416232

> Email: sales@vtecauto.com.sg

> Website: www.vtecauto.com.sg [1]

>

> 0n 2021-04-24 11:43, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:

>> Without Prejudice

>>

>> Dear Sirs/Mdm,

>>

>> We refer to the above matter.

>>

>> For COR, recommended amount at L/sum $7,500.00(before GST) with 10
>> repair days.

>>

>> Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final

>> repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to us (LKK) for

>our

>> necessary action.

>>

>> Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

>>

>> “Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter

> is

>> purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

>> resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal

>> proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed
>/

>> inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

>>

>> In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently

>> produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on

> the

>> issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter,

> by

>> the negotiation terms/settlement.”

>>

>> Best Regards,

>> Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

>> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

>> Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 Blk
>51,

>> Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

>>
>>
>>
>> From: sales@vtecauto.com.sg <sales@vtecauto.com.sg>

>> Sent: Thursday, 18 March 2021 5:30 PM

>> To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

>> Subject: Re: [Request for Video Footage] - Your Ref: SMX3369L // LKK

>> Ref: CC4/A1G21003371/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFK 7071U(AIG) AND SMX
>

>>3369L ON 10/03/2021]

>>

>> Dear Hsiao Tong,

>>




>> Good day to you!

>>

>> Could | have someone's contact number? In order for me to send the
>> Video over via Whatapps?

>>

>> -

>>Thanks & Regards,

>>

>> Jolin

>> V-Tec Asia Automotive Pte Ltd

>> 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #07-08/09

>> Premier@KB Singapore 415875

>>Tel :6635 2706

>>HP :8777 1911

>>Fax :63416232

>> Email: sales@vtecauto.com.sg

>> Website: www.vtecauto.com.sg [1] [1]

>>

>>0n 2021-03-18 17:29, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:

>>> Your Ref: SMX3369L

>>> Without Prejudice

>>>

>>> LKK Ref: CC4/A1G21003371/Upa3

>>>

>>> Dear Sirs/Mdm,

>>>

>>> ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFK 7071U(AIG) AND SMX 3369L ON 10/03/2021
>>>

>>> We refer to the above matter.

>>>

>>> We would like to request for a copy of video footage as stated in
>> your

>>> client report for our necessary action.

>>>

>>> Appreciate an early reply.

>>>

>>> "Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter
>is

>>> purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
>>> resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal
>>> proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

> deemed

>> /

>>> inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

>>>

>>> In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently
>> produced

>>> by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
>> of

>>> liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the
>>> negotiation terms/settlement."

>>>

>>> Best Regards,

>>>

>>> Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

>>>



>>> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

>>>

>>> Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
>>>

>>>HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

>>> 5(408933)

>>

>>

>> Links:

>> [1] http://www.vtecauto.com.sg
>
>

> Links:

> [1] http://www.vtecauto.com.sg



