




 

 

 
RELEASE VOUCHER 

(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim) 
 

 
“We/I,  ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD (“the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/I have 
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK 
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for 
S$2,520.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no. SLJ 4838D that was damaged pursuant to the accident 
which occurred on 14/12/2019 (date) along OPEN CARPARK OF BLK 310 SERANGOON 
AVE 2 (location) involving vehicle no/s SKW 1694P. 
 
This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 18/12/2019 (date) at “the workshop”. 
 

We/I confirm that we/I are/am authorized by the owner GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD (the third 
party claimant”) of vehicle no. SLJ 4838D  make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and 
we/I have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/I 
enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”. 
 
We/I further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, 
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party 
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and 
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the 
damage to SLJ 4838D (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident. 
 
We/I confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the 
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a 
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.  
 
This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have 
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.  
 
 
Dated this _________ (day) of _____________ (month) 20___ (year) 
 
 
 
 
___ ____________________     ______________________________ 
Signed by appointed surveyor     Signed by “the workshop” (with chop) 

06 Apr 21
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Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW 1694P(AIG) AND SLJ 4838D AT/ALONG SERANGOON
AVE 2 CARPARK NEAR BOUNDARY RD EXIT ON 14/12/2019

Chao Wei Sitoh <spheregarden@hotmail.com>
Fri 12/3/2021 5:02 PM
To:  Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Ok, thank you.  

Get Outlook for Android

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Friday, March 12, 2021 3:12:59 PM 
To: Chao Wei Sitoh <spheregarden@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW 1694P(AIG) AND SLJ 4838D AT/ALONG SERANGOON AVE 2 CARPARK
NEAR BOUNDARY RD EXIT ON 14/12/2019
 
Hi Mr Chao Wei,
 
We will procced to resolve with third party at 50/50 basis as both par�es should exercise cau�on.
 
No further ac�on is required from your end if you agreed to let AIG se�le the ma�er.
 
Thanks.
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: Chao Wei Sitoh <spheregarden@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, 12 March 2021 2:46 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW 1694P(AIG) AND SLJ 4838D AT/ALONG SERANGOON AVE 2 CARPARK NEAR
BOUNDARY RD EXIT ON 14/12/2019
 
Hi,
I'm a little confused.
So what's the conclusion again?
Because this accident was in 2019 and it's now 2021.

Regards

https://aka.ms/ghei36
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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Chao Wei

Get Outlook for Android
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Friday, March 12, 2021 2:37:48 PM 
To: Chao Wei Sitoh <spheregarden@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW 1694P(AIG) AND SLJ 4838D AT/ALONG SERANGOON AVE 2 CARPARK
NEAR BOUNDARY RD EXIT ON 14/12/2019
 
Hi Mr Chao Wei,
 
We did not deny that third party has started moving, but the fact is should our driver slowing down or stop her
vehicle upon knowing third party was moving on her le� and oncoming vehicle turning le� from the right
direc�on, the collision could have been avoided instead, our driver con�nue moving and swerve towards le� as
resulted collision. Therefore, both par�es failed to take evasive ac�on to avoid collision are contributory liable for
the accident.
 
Hope the above clarified.
 
 
 

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
From: Chao Wei Sitoh <spheregarden@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 11 March 2021 10:01 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW 1694P(AIG) AND SLJ 4838D AT/ALONG SERANGOON AVE 2 CARPARK NEAR
BOUNDARY RD EXIT ON 14/12/2019
 
Hi.
Thanks.
Check the video at 16:34:25 of the timestamp or 6th second of the video. His wheel started moving while
my mother was already beside him at his blind spot. Judging from that if he did not move, my car
would've made it around without collision.

Regards
Chao Wei

Get Outlook for Android
 

https://aka.ms/ghei36
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:spheregarden@hotmail.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:spheregarden@hotmail.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
https://aka.ms/ghei36
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, March 11, 2021 9:47:10 AM 
To: Chao Wei Sitoh <spheregarden@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW 1694P(AIG) AND SLJ 4838D AT/ALONG SERANGOON AVE 2 CARPARK
NEAR BOUNDARY RD EXIT ON 14/12/2019
 
Hi Mr Chao Wei,
 
A�ached as requested.
 
 
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: Chao Wei Sitoh <spheregarden@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 11 March 2021 9:11 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW 1694P(AIG) AND SLJ 4838D AT/ALONG SERANGOON AVE 2 CARPARK NEAR
BOUNDARY RD EXIT ON 14/12/2019
 
Hi Hsiao Tong,

Can you please send me your copy of my video to look through it again. I significantly saw the car move
on the left side of the video as my car is passing the other car.

Regards
Chao Wei.

Get Outlook for Android
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, March 11, 2021 8:23:23 AM 
To: spheregarden@hotmail.com <spheregarden@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW 1694P(AIG) AND SLJ 4838D AT/ALONG SERANGOON AVE 2 CARPARK
NEAR BOUNDARY RD EXIT ON 14/12/2019
 
Hi Mr Chao Wei,
 
Thank you for your email.
 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:spheregarden@hotmail.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:spheregarden@hotmail.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
https://aka.ms/ghei36
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:spheregarden@hotmail.com
mailto:spheregarden@hotmail.com
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No though third party vehicle was sta�onary before the collision, but he had shows his right signal lamp which
indicated his inten�on to move off. Your vehicle was overtaking third party vehicle from the right, there is another
oncoming taxi turning in from the right direc�on, so in order to avoid face to face collision, your vehicle swerved
toward le� lane where third party started to move off. We are of the view that liability is to be shared equally as
both par�es should exercise cau�on and due care. Therefore, we shall proceed to nego�ate for an amicable
se�lement of the third party claim at best to avoid further li�ga�on, which would escalate to even more cost.
 
Please be assured that we will do our due diligence to mi�gate the cost.
 
Please contact us if you have further queries. Thanks.
 
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: Chao Wei Sitoh <spheregarden@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 9 March 2021 8:28 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW 1694P(AIG) AND SLJ 4838D AT/ALONG SERANGOON AVE 2 CARPARK NEAR
BOUNDARY RD EXIT ON 14/12/2019
 
Hi.

According to the video, he was stationary and only started moving after my car was already beside him
and it's the responsibility of a driver to check for blind spots before moving any vehicle.
On that note, should he not move. The left swerve avoiding the taxi would have missed him. But
because he was moving at the same time, the collision occured.

Regards
Chao Wei

Get Outlook for Android
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, March 9, 2021 12:03:38 PM 
To: spheregarden@hotmail.com <spheregarden@hotmail.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW 1694P(AIG) AND SLJ 4838D AT/ALONG SERANGOON AVE 2 CARPARK NEAR
BOUNDARY RD EXIT ON 14/12/2019
 
09 March 2021
                                                               
Mr Sitoh Chao Wei                                                             [By Email Only]

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:spheregarden@hotmail.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
https://aka.ms/ghei36
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:spheregarden@hotmail.com
mailto:spheregarden@hotmail.com
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Dear Sir/Madam,
 
You Ref: SKW1694P
Our Ref: CC4/AIG19022355/Kpa3q2-1
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW 1694P(AIG) AND SLJ 4838D AT/ALONG SERANGOON AVE 2 CARPARK NEAR
BOUNDARY RD EXIT ON 14/12/2019
 
We refer to the above subject ma�er. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third party claim against your policy.
 
We have received a claim from SLJ4838D against your insurance policy.
               
We have reviewed the ma�er and based on all the available informa�on on hand, we are of the view that we do
not have a good defense towards the claim submi�ed by SLJ4838D. From your video footage, we observe that
third party was moving off from the sta�onary posi�on while our vehicle was overtaking and swerved a bit to the
le� as resulted the collision. Both par�es should exercise cau�on on this ma�er.  We shall proceed to nego�ate
for an amicable se�lement of the third party claim at best to avoid further li�ga�on, which would escalate to
even more cost.
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the ma�er prior to our nego�a�ons and se�lement, please
contact us within 07 days from the date of this le�er.
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third Party
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed u�lized for this claim and your NCD
will be protected.
 
Please call us if you have further queries.
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
20 Dec
2019
14:22

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD. Claimant's ID: -> 201617200G. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
20 Dec
2019
14:22

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(205436) TOYOTA PRIUS HYBRID 1.8 CVT (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
20 Dec
2019
14:22

Clm Created
Reg No: SLJ4838D. Acct Date: 2019/12/14. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lt
d. (SG). TP Insurer: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ). Workshop: Esteem Performance Pte Lt
d (HQ)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
20 Dec
2019
14:22

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
20 Dec
2019
14:22

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2020/01/02 [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

6
20 Dec
2019
14:22

Adj Mandate
Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

7
20 Dec
2019
14:22

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Ex
press)

[I] Merimen
Administrator

8
20 Dec
2019
14:22

Label Added (19):Fastlane. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

9
20 Dec
2019
14:22

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> KENNETH KONG [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

10
26 Dec
2019
16:55

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHAN JIA

LE

11
09 Jan
2020
15:13

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Ler,

Bernard-JQ

12
20 Jan
2020
17:28

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Ler,

Bernard-JQ

13
06 Mar
2020
09:09

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Shahzlan

Bin Laili

14
06 Mar
2020
15:16

Label
Removed (19):Fastlane. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

15
06 Mar
2020
15:16

Label Added (64):Revoked / No settlement. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

16
09 Mar
2020
12:29

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

17
09 Mar
2020
12:29

Clm Dtl
Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

18
09 Mar
2020
12:29

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2016/12/14.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

19
09 Mar
2020
12:29

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

20
12 Mar
2020
10:29

Adj Ofr Auth
Verified Verified: 4257.82 [A] Lee Su Li

21
12 Mar
2020
10:29

Adjuster Tax
Invoice
Issued

Submitted Tax Invoice: -> AC2002059. [A] Lee Su Li

22
12 Mar
2020
10:29

Adj Rpt
Submitted Amt:4257.82. Late Remarks: [A] Lee Su Li

23
12 Mar
2020
10:29

Adj Invoice
Submitted [A] Lee Su Li

24
12 Mar
2020
10:29

Ins Rpt-For-
Repairer
Sent

Rpt-type 1 [A] Lee Su Li

25
12 Mar
2020
10:29

Ins Ofr
Authorized Approved amt: 0.00 (nett) [A] Lee Su Li

26
12 Mar
2020
10:29

Claimant Ofr
Acceptance
Bypassed

[A] Lee Su Li

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=83414685&CFTOKEN=8eb65752d9963453-A03A18ED-E4A0-E30A-978A084490642EA6&USID=3251&RID=5027675
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=83414685&CFTOKEN=8eb65752d9963453-A03A18ED-E4A0-E30A-978A084490642EA6&USID=3251&RID=5027675
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=83414685&CFTOKEN=8eb65752d9963453-A03A18ED-E4A0-E30A-978A084490642EA6&USID=3251&RID=5027675
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=83414685&CFTOKEN=8eb65752d9963453-A03A18ED-E4A0-E30A-978A084490642EA6&USID=3251&RID=5027675&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D898789%26extid%3D326419%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=83414685&CFTOKEN=8eb65752d9963453-A03A18ED-E4A0-E30A-978A084490642EA6&USID=3251&RID=5027675
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  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

27
25 Jan
2021
10:38

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

28
09 Mar
2021
17:23

Ins Send
Back Adj Rpt

[I] Ler,
Bernard-JQ

29
09 Mar
2021
17:23

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/03/11 [I] Merimen

Administrator

30
09 Mar
2021
17:23

Adj Mandate
Set Maintained. [I] Merimen

Administrator

31
09 Mar
2021
17:29

Label
Removed (64):Revoked / No settlement. [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

32
09 Mar
2021
17:29

Label Added (19):Fastlane. [A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

33
10 Mar
2021
15:03

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

34
11 Mar
2021
09:45

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

35
15 Mar
2021
16:09

Claim Offer
Type
Changed

Offer Type: Contract Repair->Cost of Repairs [A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

36
15 Mar
2021
16:21

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:2529.31:Liability:50% *Quantum:[(a)CORw/GST: $4,505.07 + (b)LOR(7days x $76.95): $53
8.65]@50% =$2,521.86 + (c)LTA/GIA search fee: $7.45 = Total: $2,529.31 *4 recommendation repair
days + 1Sunday + 2PRS = 7days *For your approval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

37
22 Mar
2021
13:36

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Khoo,

Kay-Eng

38
22 Mar
2021
13:43

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/03/11 [I] Khoo,

Kay-Eng

39
22 Mar
2021
13:43

Adj Mandate
Set Approved:2529.31. [I] Khoo,

Kay-Eng

Date From    Date To    Audit Type None Go

 
ACTIVITY
[09/03/2021 11:55] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Called OI, Mr Sitoh. Advised him that TP had appealed for this matter. We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that both parties
should exercise caution. We propose 50/50 for this matter. OI noted and agreed to let AIG handle.

 
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2384766 23 Dec 2019
12:46:56 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SLJ4838D Abu Kassim,
Noor Mariesa xx.xx

2384772 23 Dec 2019
12:49:51

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SLJ4838D SKW1694P 11.77

2462292 09 Mar 2020
12:29:20

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SLJ4838D SKW1694P 11.77

 
 



4/7/2021 Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=898789&extid=326419&CFID=834… 3/3


