Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 March 2022 10:35 AM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: £ TP VEHICLE PC 3806S CLAIMS AGAINST CHINA TAIPING DOA: 02/03/2021

&4 A: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

C&i%: 2022 £ 3 A 8 H 10:34:34 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

e A : Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>
FE @i Re: TP VEHICLE PC 3806S CLAIMS AGAINST CHINA TAIPING DOA: 02/03/2021

Dear Shaiu Chan,

We confirm COR at $2,000 (before GST) and 2 days.

Warmest regards,

Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295

On Friday, 4 March 2022, 02:03:29 pm SGT, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <guogiang@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Steven,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $2000/- with 2 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Regards,

Guo Qiang

From: Thiam Heng Huat [mailto:thh176@yahoo.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 March, 2022 11:05 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: TP VEHICLE PC 3806S CLAIMS AGAINST CHINA TAIPING DOA: 02/03/2021



Dear Shiau Cha

Please expedite on this case and revert with the COR and repair days.

Warmest regards,
Steven
Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd

82636295

On Thursday, 15 April 2021, 02:26:08 pm SGT, Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com> wrote:

Hi Shiau Chan,

Please see attached GIA report and estimate.

Warmest regards,

Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd

82636295

On Thursday, 15 April 2021, 02:12:10 pm SGT, Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Jenny,

As spoken with you.



Kindly provide us the GIA report and estimate of PC 3806S.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



