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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 20 May 2022 5:06 PM
To: Joseph Koh
Cc: Ikhwan
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMP 2117X & SLJ 414U ON 09/03/2021 *** LKK REF : 

CC4/AIG21003212/Grs3q2
Attachments: DV_SMP 2117X.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to your below email. 
 
We confirm settlement at $5,785.45(all-in). 
 
Please duly sign the document enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Joseph Koh <joseph.koh@bifrostauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 18 March 2022 4:19 PM 
To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Ikhwan <claims_rar@bifrostauto.com> 
Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMP 2117X & SLJ 414U ON 09/03/2021 *** LKK REF : 
CC4/AIG21003212/Grs3q2 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Jaslin, 
 
There is GST billed in the rental invoice. Appreciate if we can close at $5785.45. 
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Please send over DV if agreeable, thank you. 
 
1. Repair Cost $ 4,815.00 
2. Loss of Rental for 09 Days x $107/- per day $ 963.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search fee $ 7.45 
 TOTAL $ 5,785.45 

 
The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages arising 
therefrom are excluded from the ambit and application of this document. 
 
GST at 7% is chargeable if applicable 
 
Joseph Koh 
Claims Department 
M: 96488228 
 
BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD 
6001 Beach Road, Golden Mile Tower, #22-01 
Singapore 199589 
 
 
 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Claims Dept <claims_ltr@bifrostauto.com> 
Date: Thu, 17 Mar 2022 at 16:34 
Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMP 2117X & SLJ 414U ON 09/03/2021 *** LKK REF : 
CC4/AIG21003212/Grs3q2 
To: Claims Dept <claims@bifrostauto.com> 
 

Dear Joseph 
 
FYNA 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 
Date: Fri, 28 Jan 2022 at 11:42 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMP 2117X & SLJ 414U ON 09/03/2021 *** LKK REF : CC4/AIG21003212/Grs3q2 
To: Claims Dept <claims_ltr@bifrostauto.com> 
Cc: Claims Dept <claims_ltv@bifrostauto.com>, Claims Dept <claims_lts@bifrostauto.com>, Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

We refer to the above matter. 

We propose settlement as follows: - 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)  $ 4,815.00  
2. Loss of Rental (9 days x $100.00)    $ 900.00  
3. GIA Search Fee   $ 7.45   
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Total  $ 5,722.45  

 Please confirm acceptance. 

  

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


