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Re: [EXTERNAL] Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YOUR INSURED SHC7228D & OUR
CLIENT'S VEHICLE SGW1149U ALONG ECP TOWARDS CITY ON 08.03.21 *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM21003192/Kpa3

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Tue 30/11/2021 4:25 PM
To:  Tan Alan <atautoconsultant@gmail.com>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with dereg letter/docs to us (LKK) for our
necessary action. 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan Alan <atautoconsultant@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 November 2021 4:43 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YOUR INSURED SHC7228D & OUR CLIENT'S VEHICLE
SGW1149U ALONG ECP TOWARDS CITY ON 08.03.21 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM21003192/Kpa3
 
Hi Hsiao Tong,

Please go ahead with your offer. Thanks.

Rgds
Alan

On Mon, Nov 29, 2021, 14:44 Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice


Hi Alan,
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We refer to your below email.


We are prepared to revise our offer at a global sum of $4,000.00(all-in).


Please confirm acceptance.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on

the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Tan Alan <atautoconsultant@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 26 November 2021 3:51 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YOUR INSURED SHC7228D & OUR CLIENT'S VEHICLE
SGW1149U ALONG ECP TOWARDS CITY ON 08.03.21 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM21003192/Kpa3
 
Hi Hsiao Tong,


Please help to propose to revising to all in @ 5000, thank you.


Rgds
Alan


On Wed, Nov 24, 2021 at 10:41 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:


Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Total Loss Value $ 3,000.00
2. Loss of Use (7days x $50.00)  $    350.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee  $        7.45
4. Towing Fee $    120.00

Total  $ 3,477.45

Please confirm acceptance.
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole

intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,

whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence

on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 12 April 2021 12:14 pm

To: Tan Alan <atautoconsultant@gmail.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YOUR INSURED SHC7228D & OUR CLIENT'S VEHICLE
SGW1149U ALONG ECP TOWARDS CITY ON 08.03.21 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM21003192/Kpa3
 
Dear Sir / Madam,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
Please provide us the following.

GIA / police report
Estimated cost of repair

 
Our respective case handler, Hsiao Tong will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Tuesday, 16 March, 2021 3:41 PM

To: Tan Alan <atautoconsultant@gmail.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng
(LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YOUR INSURED SHC7228D & OUR CLIENT'S VEHICLE
SGW1149U ALONG ECP TOWARDS CITY ON 08.03.21 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM21003192/Kpa3
 
Dear Sir / Madam,
 
We refer to the above matter.
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Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement.
 

 

 
Please provide us the following and arrange for survey.

evidence i.e. video and scene photo
PIR result (if any)
GIA / police report
Estimated cost of repair

 
Our respective case handler, Hsiao Tong will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Tan Alan <atautoconsultant@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, 9 March, 2021 6:11 PM
To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YOUR INSURED SHC7228D & OUR
CLIENT'S VEHICLE SGW1149U ALONG ECP TOWARDS CITY ON 08.03.21
 
We are agreeable to select LKK as the SJE for the above-mentioned case. Thank
you.
 
Rgds
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Alan
 
On Tue, Mar 9, 2021 at 12:36 AM Tan Alan <atautoconsultant@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Sir,
 
 
Attached herewith the Notification Of Accident for your reference.
 
Kindly let us have a list of your ten surveyors as your nominated SJE for our consideration
within the stipulated timeline under the NIMA Protocol. 
 

**Vehicle in at Blk 1 Sin Ming Industrial Sector C # 01-135.
 
--
Rgds
Alan Tan
83868989
A T Auto Consultant

 
--
Rgds
Alan Tan
83868989
A T Auto Consultant





-- 

Rgds
Alan Tan
83868989
A T Auto Consultant
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