Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 December 2017 11:36 AM

To: Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: your ref: 17/17/17/VP05/019676Accident Involving SIB7201L and SMB1649H
..MANDATE REQUEST TO REJECT TP CLAIM

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Dear Jas

Please go ahead with your recommendation.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) [mailto:jaskhine@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 December, 2017 10:59 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: your ref: 17/17/17/VP05/019676Accident Involving SIB7201L and SMB1649H ...MANDATE REQUEST TO
REJECT TP CLAIM

Dear Li Li,
We refer to the above matter and as discussed earlier.

TP reported that he was travelling straight along Upper Bukit Timah Road towards Tampines at extreme left lane,
suddenly our insured vehicle trying to overtake his bus and side swipe to his right front portion.

A
i:¢||-|"|q-:':'-:_ .,.r'-‘-‘:'{'.'l‘

5 BU,J:.(, | AT i

-1
oF. 3 e s | e —
A R 1
o m— 'E: b :
.’I: 3 1 = guts
f lued |« 14
h_l'l'ﬂ 0 : _l
AVE sSng
e . & a |
R T R R gl A
N e | dees = )0



Ol reported that TP was moving out from bus bay and collided to his vehicle while he passing by the bus stop.
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We have requested TP to provide evidence for our further consideration. However, TP unable to provide any evidences.

Based on damages sustained to both vehicles, we are of the opinion that at the time of the collision TP vehicle was
slanting position. TP bus sustained damages onto right front corner and our insured vehicle sustained long grazed marks
along its left side body, it’s subjected that one vehicle is slanting position at the time of the collision. If both vehicles
side swipe as alleged by Third Party, his bus should not be sustained damage on its right front portion corner only but
also should have damages on its right side body.

Therefore, our insured version is more probable and we are intending to reject Third Party claim.
Kindly let us have your view/instruction/comments if any.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Agnes Lim (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 13 February, 2017 12:13 PM

To: geraldpoh@lonpac.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'ONG LI LI' <llong@Ilonpac.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto)
<jaskhine@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJIB7201L (Ol : LPC - TBA) and SMB1649H (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/LPC17002778/K1yg3) on 06.02.2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle SMB 1649H at M/s SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands) - Woodlands.



Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
- TP estimate
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jas and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2928.
Thank you.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Agnes Lim| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: AgnesLim@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



