Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com>
Sent: Thursday, 2 September 2021 7:54 AM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SKZ 6081 J MAZDA 3 ------ FINALIZE
HI Taufikh,

Accert and closed at 6k and 7day

kindly submit your surveyor report to insurance ASAP

Regards,

XIONG

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims @rico60.com

On Wed, Sep 1, 2021 at 11:04 PM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Xiong,

Refer attached, COR I/s $6000 , 7 days.

Subject to insurance approval



Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Rico 60 Claims [mailto:claims@rico60.com]

Sent: Saturday, 17 April 2021 8:57 AM

To: TAUFIKH@LKKAUTO.COM; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Rico 60 Enquiry
Subject: Re: SKZ 6081 ] MAZDA 3 ------ FINALIZE

HI Tauflkh,

Attached is the after paint photos for your reference.

Kindly assist us to finalize this case.

Regards,

XIONG

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims @rico60.com




On Fri, Mar 12, 2021 at 12:55 PM Rico 60 Claims <claims @rico60.com> wrote:

HI Tauflkh

Kindly assist us to finalize this case.

Pls check & revert to us soon.

Regards,xiong

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims @rico60.com




