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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 18 May 2022 16:05
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP5887U & SHD4041P 

ALONG YISHUN ST 71 ON 5.3.2020 [External General] *** LKK REF: 
CC4/LPC21003089/Gea3q2

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Asher, 
 
Please proceed as proposed. 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 18 May 2022 1:42 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP5887U & SHD4041P ALONG YISHUN ST 71 ON 
5.3.2020 [External General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC21003089/Gea3q2 
 
Hi Gerald, 
 
We refer to our email dated 08.04.22. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval  / instruction if any. 
 
 
Thank You.  
 

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 8 April 2022 23:21 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP5887U & SHD4041P ALONG YISHUN ST 71 ON 5.3.2020 
[External General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC21003089/Gea3q2 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
The accident occurred when both parties reversed and collided into each other (both party have no evidence). 
 
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 50% liability. 
 
Summary to offer to repairer COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD is as follows: - 
 

 Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 6,748.55 $ 4,119.50 
2. Loss of Rental (4days x $112.67) $    450.68 $    338.01 (3days x $112.67) 
3. Loss of Income (4days x $80) $    320.00 $    150.00 (3days x $50) 
 Sub Total $ 4,607.51 
 50% $ 2,303.76 
4. LTA/GIA Search Fee $       2.00 $        2.00 

Total $ 7,521.23 $ 2,305.76 
 
**3 days recommendation for repair. 
 
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
 
The above is for your approval please. 
 
Thank You.  
 
Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 2 March 2022 10:15 AM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP5887U & SHD4041P ALONG YISHUN ST 71 ON 5.3.2020 [External General] *** 
LKK REF: CC4/LPC21003089/Gea3q2 
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Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
 
Hi Asher, 
 
Kindly assist. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 1 March, 2022 5:04 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP5887U & SHD4041P ALONG YISHUN ST 71 ON 5.3.2020 [External General] 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Mei Kwan, 
 
Please let us have an update on the current status. 
 
The date of loss should be 5/3/2021 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 4:50 pm 
To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP5887U & SHD4041P ALONG YISHUN ST 71 ON 5.3.2020 [External General] 
 
Lonpac External - General 
Dear Mei Kwan, 
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Attached addendum for your attention. 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices. 
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 
 
From: Shaipul Bahri Idris [mailto:shaipul@shai-klin.com]  
Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 4:42 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN  
Subject: Re: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP5887U & SHD4041P ALONG YISHUN ST 71 ON 5.3.2020 [External General] 
 
Hi Gerald 
 
Please see the attached for the amendment. 
 
Best regards 
Shaipul 
SHAI-KLIN 
 
On Mon, Mar 15, 2021 at 10:01 AM GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote: 

Lonpac External - General 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

Please confirm the date of accident. 

  

Best Regards 

Gerald Poh 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
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Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

  

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

  

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN  
Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 7:55 am 
To: 'shaipul@shai-klin.com' <shaipul@shai-klin.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP5887U & SHD4041P ALONG YISHUN ST 71 ON 5.3.2020 
[External General] 

  

Lonpac External - General 

  

Our Ref: 20/21/21/VC05/024305 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

We refer to our letter of 9 March 2021 requesting the driver to lodge the accident 
report 

which was sent under registered cover to you. 

  

We have received the report but the date of accident reported by the driver was 
8/3/2021 

whereas the driver of SHD4041P states that the accident as 5/3/2021. 
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Please arrange for the driver to amend the report if the date of accident was 5/3/2021. 

In addition, the third party vehicle should be SHA4041P and not SHD4041F. 

  

  

Best Regards 

Gerald Poh 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 

  

  

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

  

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

  


