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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 6 May 2021 3:45 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING  SLH8033T  AND AIG INSURED SLS6640X    DATED 

6/3/21 LKK REF : CC6/AIG21003071/gs3

Hi Cecilia 
 
 
 
 
We submit SLH8033T claim as follow :  
 
 
Repair cost                :S$    1284.00  
 
Loss earning /use  : S$  1000.00 (days including PRI) 
 
Please let us have your offer to settle . 
 
 
Thank you & Best  Regards, 
Jouis Seow  
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd 
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10  
Singapore 539195. 
  
Tel        : (65) 62898126 
Fax       : (65) 62870590 
Email    : jouis@jinauto.com.sg  
  
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 15 April 2021 4:14 PM 
To: 'jouis' <jouis@jinauto.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH8033T AND AIG INSURED SLS6640X DATED 6/3/21 LKK REF : 
CC6/AIG21003071/gs3 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Jouis, 
 
Kindly forward your LOD and other documents to me once you have done.  
 
Thanks  
 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 
 





 
RELEASE VOUCHER 

(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim) 
 

 
“We/I, JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/I have reached 
an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO 
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S$1,284.00 
(Repair Cost), S$300.00 (Loss of Use/Rental), S$ -_ (Disbursement) for vehicle no. SLH 8033T that 
was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 06/03/2021 (date) along/at Merchant Rd 
(location) involving vehicle no/s SLS 6640X.  
 
This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 14/04/2021 (date) at “the workshop”. 
 

We/I confirm that we/I are/am authorized by the owner SEAH KOK KEAN (“the third party 
claimant”) of vehicle no. SLH 8033T make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/I have 
full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/I enclose herein 
the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”. 
 
We/I further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, 
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant” 
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses 
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SLH 
8033T (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident. 
 
We/I confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the 
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without 
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.  
 
This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have 
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.  
 
 
Dated this ____ _____ (day) of _____________ (month) 20__ _ (year) 
 
 
 
 
___ ___     _______     ______________________________ 
Signed by appointed surveyor     Signed by “the workshop” (with chop) 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 13 April 2021 2:08 PM
To: Davidchan@sweelee.com.sg
Subject: <STANDARD NOTIFICATION LETTER> OUR REF: CC6/AIG21003071/gs3 *** 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 6640X & SLH 8033T ON 06/03/2021 ***

Our Ref: CC6/AIG21003071/gs3                                                                                  
 
13 APRIL 2021 
 
CHAN MUN HOE, DAVID 
DRIVER: Kho Wen Xin 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 6640X & SLH 8033T ON 06/03/202 

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your Motor Insurer 
(AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto 
Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SLH 8033T. 
                 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate 
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial 
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will 
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
c.c   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd       
           (Motor Claims Dept) 
 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 



2

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 




