4/11/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Your Ref: SLC1865G // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21003061/Upa3[ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SLJ 2928R(AIG) AND SLC 1865G ON 25/02/2021]

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sun 11/4/2021 11:14 AM

To: contact@revoperformance.com.sg <contact@revoperformance.com.sg>

[ﬂJ 1 attachments (193 KB)
DV_SLC1865G.pdf;

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We confirm settlement at $1,999.00(all-in) as per your LOD.

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 8:24 AM

To: contact@revoperformance.com.sg <contact@revoperformance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLC1865G // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21003061/Upa3[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ 2928R(AIG)
AND SLC 1865G ON 25/02/2021]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We are pending mandate approval from AIG.

We will follow up and get back to you.

Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
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deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: contact@revoperformance.com.sg <contact@revoperformance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 26 March 2021 5:12 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLC1865G // LKK Ref: CC4/A1G21003061/Upa3[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ 2928R(AIG)
AND SLC 1865G ON 25/02/2021]

Without Prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong,

May | know is there any finalise for our client?
Please advise.

Thanks & Regards

Joey Chong

Revo Performance Pte Ltd
Tel : 6745 6706

Fax : 6484 3653

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, March 15, 2021 11:31 AM

To: contact@revoperformance.com.sg

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLC1865G // LKK Ref: CC4/A1G21003061/Upa3[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ
2928R(AIG) AND SLC 1865G ON 25/02/2021]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 15/03/2021.

We will look into the matter and get back to you. Thanks.
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: contact@revoperformance.com.sg <contact@revoperformance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 11:07 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLC1865G // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21003061/Upa3[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ 2928R(AIG)
AND SLC 1865G ON 25/02/2021]

Dear Sir / Madam ,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : (SLC 1865 G & SLJ 2928 R) ALONG 502 JURONG
WEST AVE 1 OPEN CARPARK

DOA : 25/02/2021 TIME : 1730 HOURS
We refer to the above matter and write on behalf of NEO PENG SIONG

The registered owner of SLC 1865 G in respect of the above
accident

We are instructed that the above accident was caused by your insured’s
negligent

driving / or management of your insured vehicle
Your insured’s vehicle SL] 2928 R collided onto the rear portion of our client’s
vehicle SLC 1865 G, As a result of the accident , Our client has been put to loss

and
expenses ,Particulars of which are as follows :

1. Cost of repair ($ 1700 + 7% GST) $1,819.00
2. Loss of use ( $60 x 3 days ) $ 180.00
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Total Amount : $ 1,999.00

Enclosed are the following documents for your
perusal

1) Owner ‘s driving license / Identity

card

2) Certificate of

insurance

3) GIA

report

4) Original repair Tax invoice

Our company is not the authorized workshop of any of the GIA member
companies

and we are writing in purely for amicable sake .
The demand herein is in respect of our client’s for damages pertaining to his
motor

vehicle and any settlement following or subsequent to this demand shall not

prejudice any claim in respect of personal injuries

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above said documents within 7 days and your

favourable reply is deeply appreciated

Your faithfully

l4

Thank you
Benjamin

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, March 15, 2021 9:54 AM

To: contact@revoperformance.com.sg

Subject: Your Ref: SLC1865G // LKK Ref: CC4/A1G21003061/Upa3[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ 2928R(AIG)
AND SLC 1865G ON 25/02/2021]

Your Ref: SLC1865G Without Prejudice
LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21003061/Upa3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ 2928R(AIG) AND SLC 1865G ON 25/02/2021

We refer to the above matter.
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Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

EKETCH PLAN

DESCRIBE CIRCUMST ANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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DECLARATION

We would like to request for a copy of video footage as stated in your client report for our necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)
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