Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 8:53 AM

To: '‘Chew Siew Yong Joe'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: India International SJW2811Z OD-DOA: 28/2/21
Attachments: NEW OD Claim Satisfaction Discharge Voucher.pdf
Dear Joe,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SIW 2811Z on Lump Sum Repair,
(Excess $750/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*QOur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew Siew Yong Joe <js.garage@icloud.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 9 March 2021 4:28 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: India International SJIW2811Z OD









Sent from my iPhone

On Mar 9, 2021, at 2:30 PM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Joe,

Kindly forward copy of driver’s driving licensed requested by Il

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 March 2021 5:52 PM

To: 'Chew Siew Yong Joe' <js.garage@icloud.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: India International S/IW2811Z OD

Dear Joe,

Please re-direct email to India International.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew Siew Yong Joe <js.garage@icloud.com>
Sent: Friday, 5 March 2021 5:40 PM

To: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: India International SJW2811Z OD

Hi there,

On behalf of my customer SJIW2811Z, insurance by India International.
We could like to engage a surveyor for a estimate from LKK for OD.

Please find attached Report and estimate documents
Thank you

Regards,

Joe Chew

J's Garage Pte Ltd
48 Toh Guan Road East, Enterprise Hub



#02-108 Singapore 608586
Tel: +65 69093100

FAX: +65 69093100
Mobile: +65 96648646
Email: js.garage@me..com

DISCLAIMER: This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential, subject to legal privilege,
or otherwise protected from disclosure, and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity
addressed. If you have received this email in error please delete and destroy all copies in your
possession and notify the sender. Please note that any views or opinions presented in this email are
solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the J's Garage Pte Ltd. The
recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. J's Garage Pte Ltd
accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.



