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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 19 March 2021 12:52 PM
To: 'MARED4953@GMAIL.COM'
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKT 3878D(AIG) AND GBF 6326R AT/ALONG ANG MO 

KIO AVENUE 3 JUNCTION WITH AMK 10 ON 26/02/2021
Attachments: SKT3878D(FRONT VIDEO).mp4; GBF6326R( VIDEO).mp4

Dear Mr Edwin Yip  / Ms Marilyn Ma, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
We have reviewed the matter and based on all the available information on hand, we are of the view that we do not 
have a good defense towards the claim submitted by GBF6326R. Attached here with both parties video footage for 
your easy reference. From the video footage, it shows that your vehicle was on the left most lane at the traffic 
junction while third party was on your right side. After the traffic light turn green your vehicle started to move 
ahead, while moving your vehicle had encroached into third party lane and collided with third party who was driving 
within his lane. Therefore, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver favour.  We shall proceed to 
negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid further litigation, which would escalate 
to even more cost. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third-Party 
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will 
be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Mared <mared4953@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 11 March 2021 12:16 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKT 3878D(AIG) AND GBF 6326R AT/ALONG ANG MO KIO AVENUE 3 JUNCTION 
WITH AMK 10 ON 26/02/2021 
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---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Mared <mared4953@gmail.com> 
Date: Thu, Mar 11, 2021 at 11:54 AM 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKT 3878D(AIG) AND GBF 6326R AT/ALONG ANG MO KIO AVENUE 3 JUNCTION 
WITH AMK 10 ON 26/02/2021 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
 

Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
As requested, i attach the two videos and also photos of the damages to the wing mirrors and also my report dated 
1 March 2021. 
 
Please call me if you have any questions. 
 
Regards, 
 
Marilyn 

 (1) EVT_2021_02_26_16_48_06_F.MP4Error! Filename not specified. 

 (2) EVT_2021_02_26_16_48_06_R.MP4Error! Filename not specified. 

 
 
On Thu, Mar 11, 2021 at 11:25 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

11 March 2021 

  

Mr Edwin Yip Seck Tai / Ms Marilyn Ma Tien Woon                                      [By Email Only] 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

You Ref: SKT3878D 

Our Ref: CC4/AIG21003007/ps3 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKT 3878D(AIG) AND GBF 6326R AT/ALONG ANG MO KIO AVENUE 3 JUNCTION WITH AMK 
10 ON 26/02/2021 
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We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your 
motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy. 

  

We have received a claim from GBF6326R against your insurance policy. 

  

As per our tele-conversation with Ms Marilyn earlier, we would like to request for a copy of video footage as stated 
in your accident report for our further action. 

  

Appreciate an early reply. Thanks. 

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
08 Mar
2021
08:50

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> CANFORD ELECTRICAL PTE LTD. [A] Lee Su Li

2
08 Mar
2021
08:50

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(206593) OPEL COMBO L2H1 1.6 D CDTI (A). [A] Lee Su Li

3
08 Mar
2021
08:50

Clm Created Reg No: GBF6326R. Acct Date: 2021/02/26. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lt
d. (SG). Workshop: Alan's United Auto Pte Ltd (HQ) [A] Lee Su Li

4
08 Mar
2021
08:50

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] Lee Su Li

5
08 Mar
2021
08:50

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/03/17 [A] Lee Su Li

6
08 Mar
2021
08:50

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] Lee Su Li

7
08 Mar
2021
08:50

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Ex
press)

[I] Merimen
Administrator

8
08 Mar
2021
08:50

Label Added (19):Fastlane. [A] Lee Su Li

9
08 Mar
2021
08:50

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> ACCUSER4 [A] Lee Su Li

10
09 Mar
2021
17:05

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

11
12 Mar
2021
10:05

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

ACCUSER4 -> KENNETH KONG [A] Lee Su Li

12
05 Apr
2021
14:52

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] HUEY
YON

13
05 Apr
2021
14:52

Clm Dtl
Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3. [A] HUEY

YON

14
05 Apr
2021
14:52

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2017/01/11. [A] HUEY

YON

15
05 Apr
2021
14:52

Clm Details
Notified

[A] HUEY
YON

16
06 Apr
2021
11:33

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:1000.47:Liability: 100%(B15) *Quantum: (a)CORw/GST: $878.47 + (b)LOU(2days x $60.00):
$120.00 + (c)LTA/GIA search fee: $2.00 = Total: $1,000.47 *1 recommendation repair day +1PRS = 2
days *For your approval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

17
21 Apr
2021
14:40

Video
Downloaded Downloaded GBF6326R vs SKT3878D_TP VIDEO [I] Goh,

Jeremy-CX

18
21 Apr
2021
14:40

Video
Downloaded Downloaded GBF6326R vs SKT3878D_OI VIDEO(FRONT) [I] Goh,

Jeremy-CX

19
21 Apr
2021
14:41

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Goh,

Jeremy-CX

20
21 Apr
2021
15:03

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/03/17. Mandate Remarks: mandate approved. please mitigate cost,
insured not totally at fault. LOU to start from $80 up to $120.

[I] Goh,
Jeremy-CX

21
21 Apr
2021
15:03

Adj
Mandate Set

Approved:1000.47:mandate approved. please mitigate cost, insured not totally at fault. LOU to start fro
m $80 up to $120.

[I] Goh,
Jeremy-CX

Date From    Date To    Audit Type None Go

 
ACTIVITY
[21/04/2021 14:16] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Returned call to Mdm Marilyn. Inform her that the final amount is abt $1K. She agreed to let AIG settle.
[22/03/2021 16:15] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Called OID to inform her that she had NCD protector. She will let AIG to settle the claim
[19/03/2021 12:27] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Called OID at 96205913. HP off. Called 62829080. Not pick up
[11/03/2021 11:21] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Pending OI video

 
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=84206615&CFTOKEN=8db9c31d0da038e9-41EF3C8B-DF5C-2CE9-60F5F672D17D3A23&USID=3251&RID=2584283
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=84206615&CFTOKEN=8db9c31d0da038e9-41EF3C8B-DF5C-2CE9-60F5F672D17D3A23&USID=3251&RID=2584283
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=84206615&CFTOKEN=8db9c31d0da038e9-41EF3C8B-DF5C-2CE9-60F5F672D17D3A23&USID=3251&RID=2584283
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=84206615&CFTOKEN=8db9c31d0da038e9-41EF3C8B-DF5C-2CE9-60F5F672D17D3A23&USID=3251&RID=2584283&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D993200%26extid%3D357296%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=84206615&CFTOKEN=8db9c31d0da038e9-41EF3C8B-DF5C-2CE9-60F5F672D17D3A23&USID=3251&RID=2584283
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Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch)

Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2675898 09 Mar 2021
14:19:32 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

GBF6326R Low, Xianyu xx.xx

2675901 09 Mar 2021
14:23:55

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

GBF6326R SKT3878D 11.00

2676016 09 Mar 2021
17:10:19 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

GBF6326R CHEW HSIAO
TONG xx.xx

2678761 19 Mar 2021
12:22:20 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

GBF6326R CHEW HSIAO
TONG xx.xx

2683357 05 Apr 2021
14:52:19

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

GBF6326R SKT3878D 11.00

 
 


