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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Carine Yeo   TCBC <carine.yeo@borneomotors.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 March 2021 11:09 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SMJ 7321 X - FINAL BILL

Thanks Steve  

  

 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, March 25, 2021 11:06 AM 

To: Carine Yeo TCBC <carine.yeo@borneomotors.com.sg>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SMJ 7321 X - FINAL BILL 

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open attachments 

unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe. 

Hi Carine/Shiau Chan, 

 

We confirm the finalize $3252.70 (P/P, before GST). 3 repair days. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thanks. 

 
best Regards,  
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Carine Yeo TCBC <carine.yeo@borneomotors.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 25 March 2021 10:37 AM 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SMJ 7321 X - FINAL BILL  

  

Good morning Steve, 
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With reference to the above-mentioned. 
  
I have attached a copy of the Final Bill for your immediate attention.  
  
Repair Amount            :           $3252.70 + GST $227.69 = $3480.39 
Days of Repair             :           3 working days 
  

  
  
Thank you and Best Regards  
  

Carine Yeo  

Motor Claims Assessor  

  
DIRECT LINE +65 6631 1505 | MOBILE  +65 9699 6192 | FAX +65 6476 6247  
EMAIL: carine.yeo@borneomotors.com.sg  
Inchcape – Borneo Motors  I  2 Pandan Crescent, S128462 
www.borneomotors.com.sg  I  www.lexus.com.sg 
  

  

  

  


