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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Linda Phua <linda@lindaphualaw.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 March 2021 6:52 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Keline Tung

Cc: SUR; assignments

Subject: SJE REPORT OF SJA 5535S -  MSIG Ref: M468043 FF - MC/MC 11186/2020-  CLAIM 

BY YEO PEI CHING - LP/MSIG/2020-0893

Attachments: 3P_RPT.pdf; LOD.pdf; OI_RPT.PDF; SR.pdf; RI.PDF

Dear Celine  
 

1. I have managed to get the agreement of the claimant’s lawyer to jointly appoint Adrian Ling as the 
SJE for this matter.  

2. The vehicle had already been sold a few years ago. The physical reinspection is therefore not 
feasible. Can you therefore proceed with the paper reinspection for us ?  

3. Meanwhile, do note that the payment of SJE report fee is under order 108 of the rules of court.  
4. Please therefore send us 2 invoices made out equally to the following parties : - 

 
a. 50% of $300  plus GST to C Yogarajah LLC and 
b. 50% of $300 plus GST to MSIG c/o Linda Phua Law Practice  

 
5. Attached are the relevant documents : - 

 

i. Report of SJA 5535S  

ii. Letter of demand  

iii. Report of SCZ 6900R 

iv. Survey report of PAR Automotive Consultancy  

v. Report from FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd 

 

 

 

LINDA PHUA MUI LU 

 

LINDA PHUA LAW PRACTICE 

20 Havelock Road Central Square 

#02-45 Singapore 059765 

Tel: 6534 7388 

Fax: 6534 8911 

Email : linda@lindaphualaw.com 

 

This email contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) 

named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies 

of it. Thank you.  

 

 

From: "Celine Fong (LKKAuto)" <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 

Date: Tuesday, 2 February 2021 at 12:23 PM 

To: Fievel Foo <Fievel_Foo@sg.msig-asia.com>, Linda Phua <linda@lindaphualaw.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>, assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: MSIG Ref: M468043 FF - MC/MC 11186/2020-aCDR on 04 Feb 2021 CLAIM BY YEO PEI CHING - 

LP/MSIG/2016-0193 
 

Dear Linda, 
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Refer to our tele-conversation earlier.  

  

Attached herewith CV of our surveyor Mr Adrian Ling Wai Ping for your attention. 

  

Our surveyor needs approximately two to three weeks to complete the report. 

  

We are pleased to submit our Professional Fee Charges (Single Joint Expert) as follows: 

  

Paper Survey - $300.00 

  

Physical Re-inspection - $400.00 

  

Affidavit Attendance Fee: $200.00 (per hour/per trip/per person) 

  

Court Attendance Expert Witness Fee:             

  

(a) State Courts 

          i) Half day:  $300.00                     

          ii) Full day:  $600.00                    

  

 All above charges are subject to GST 7%. 

  
  

  

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

  

  

From: Fievel Foo <Fievel_Foo@sg.msig-asia.com>  

Sent: Friday, 29 January 2021 5:59 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Linda Phua <linda@lindaphualaw.com> 

Subject: MSIG Ref: M468043 FF - MC/MC 11186/2020-aCDR on 04 Feb 2021 CLAIM BY YEO PEI CHING - 

LP/MSIG/2016-0193 

  

Dear Adrian 

  

We will be appointing you for SJE. Please contact Linda regards to the matter urgently. 

  

  

������ Please note that our Customer Service Centre will accept walk-ins by appointments only. For more details on 
how you can make an appointment with us, please refer to our official Facebook page or our website at 
msig.com.sg. 
  
Thanks with regards 
  
Fievel Foo 
Executive, Claim Services (Motor) 
D: +65 6643 1316 | F: +65 6225 7402 | Fievel_Foo@sg.msig-asia.com  
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MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd  16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220 

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg            
  

 
  

  

  

 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE 
This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any 
person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended 
recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents. 


