Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 10 May, 2021 8:53 AM

To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3)

Subject: RE: SMV9479Z ; Acc date: 25.02.2021
Attachments: SMV 94797 FINAL3.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Good day, regarding your request for adjust the finalize amount.

This is the best offer to your repair cost $8,100 and DOR 3 days to settle this case.

Kindly to take noted, will be base finalized amount COR $8,100 and DOR 3 DAYS to close this case.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Oi Sun Pinl Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 May, 2021 9:30 AM

To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3)

Subject: RE: SMV9479Z ; Acc date: 25.02.2021

Dear Kelly,
We already check with other workshop price and we are adjust the final amount.
Kindly refer the finalize amount $8,100. Repair day 3 days. (L/S, before gst).

Please confirm the COR by reply email.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Oi Sun Pinl Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) [mailto:ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 3 May, 2021 11:26 AM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: SMV9479Z ; Acc date: 25.02.2021

Dear Sun Pin,

There have a typo amount for Grille at previous estimate.



