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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: Sunday, 11 April 2021 5:19 PM
To: Loi Ai Ting; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Jojo Cheng; Lauro Araos Songcuan JR; Andre Chow En De
Subject: SLU7473U, claim TP India SJW2811Z, DOA: 28/02/21
Attachments: [Untitled].pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
 
Hi Cecelia, 
 
Kindly assist. 
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

From: Loi Ai Ting [mailto:aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg]  
Sent: April 9, 2021 5:08 PM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jojo Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Lauro Araos Songcuan JR 
<lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; SUR 
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; aida@iii.com.sg 
Subject: SLU7473U, claim TP India SJW2811Z, DOA: 28/02/21 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
Attached our LOD for your perusal. 
 
Do let us know if you need the original copies to be mail to you. 
 
Our client’s claim is as stated below: 
 
COR       $ 5,606.80 
LOR        $    770.40 ($128.40/day x 6 days) 
GIA fee $         2.00 
                --------------- 
Total      $ 6,379.20 







CYCLE & CARRIAGE FRANCE PTE LIMITED

CYCLE & CARRIAGE FRANCE PTE LIMITED





No. RRA21030075
Date: 19 Mar 2021

RENTAL AGREEMENT

The Hirer (as identified below) wishes to lease from Cycle & Carriage Leasing Pte. Ltd. (UEN:
201900307R), a company incorporated in Singapore with its registered office at 239 Alexandra Road,
Singapore 159930 (“Owner”), and the Owner has agreed to lease to the Hirer, the Vehicle (as identified
below), subject to the terms and conditions set out below and in the attached Terms and Conditions of
Rental.
Hirer Particulars Vehicle Particulars
Name : Fan Wan Ping Julie C/O

Cycle & Carriage France Pte
Ltd

NRIC/FIN/PP/ROC No. : ******60G
Registered Address : - Singapore -
Mobile No. : +6597299665
Email address : Tai7237@gmail.com

Vehicle No. : SMQ4773H
Vehicle Type : Mitsubishi Outlander

Modern
Vehicle Model : OUTLANDER 2.0 CVT
Commencement Date : 23/03/2021 11:00
End Date : 29/03/2021 14:30

Driver Particulars Rental Charge
Name : Fan Wan Ping Julie C/O

Cycle & Carriage France Pte
Ltd

Driving License No. :
Issue Date : 21/06/1993
Mobile No. : +6597299665

Daily: 6 days x 120.00 $ 720.00
Weekly $ 0.00
Monthly $ 0.00
Total $ 770.40
Inclusive GST 7.0% $ 50.40
Amt Before GST $ 720.00
Deposit Amount $ 0.00

REMARKS Insurance Excess
Section I - $1500/ Section II - $1500
For drivers below age 22, or below 2 years driving
experience, additional excess of $3500 applies

 
☑ I wish to receive the latest news and promotions from Jardine Cycle & Carriage Limited. I consent to the

collection, use and disclosure of my Personal Information by Jardine Cycle & Carriage Limited and its
subsidiaries and affiliates (“JCCL”), in accordance with Clause 14.2 of the Terms and Conditions of Rental.

 
The Owner The Hirer
    

For and on behalf of
Cycle & Carriage Leasing Pte. Ltd.
Name Name : Fan Wan Ping Julie C/O Cycle & Carriage

France Pte Ltd
Designation Company Stamp (if applicable)
Date Date
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