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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: Sunday, 11 April 2021 5:19 PM
To: Loi Ai Ting; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Jojo Cheng; Lauro Araos Songcuan JR; Andre Chow En De
Subject: SLU7473U, claim TP India SJW2811Z, DOA: 28/02/21
Attachments: [Untitled].pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
 
Hi Cecelia, 
 
Kindly assist. 
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

From: Loi Ai Ting [mailto:aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg]  
Sent: April 9, 2021 5:08 PM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jojo Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Lauro Araos Songcuan JR 
<lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; SUR 
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; aida@iii.com.sg 
Subject: SLU7473U, claim TP India SJW2811Z, DOA: 28/02/21 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
Attached our LOD for your perusal. 
 
Do let us know if you need the original copies to be mail to you. 
 
Our client’s claim is as stated below: 
 
COR       $ 5,606.80 
LOR        $    770.40 ($128.40/day x 6 days) 
GIA fee $         2.00 
                --------------- 
Total      $ 6,379.20 


