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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 5 March 2021 3:31 PM
To: Low, Xianyu
Cc: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Hor, Yinrul; Subramaniam, Divyashni; Teo, Ericweihong; 

Lee, Ming-Yao; Admin A
Subject: RE: aigencrypt RE:  9678518214SG

Hi Xian Yu, 
 
Yes, third party claimant had withdrawn claim from Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd.  
 
We will proceed to close file at our end. Thanks. 
 

 
 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Low, Xianyu <Xianyu.Low@aig.com>  
Sent: Friday, 5 March 2021 3:23 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>; Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>; 
Subramaniam, Divyashni <Divyashni.Subramaniam@aig.com>; Teo, Ericweihong <Ericweihong.Teo@aig.com>; Lee, 
Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Subject: RE: aigencrypt RE: 9678518214SG 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
Noticed that there is another TP claim created by FTA.  
Kindly assist to confirm if there is a change in TP workshop from Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd to Falcon-Air Auto 
Services Pte Ltd. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Low Xian Yu 
AIG 
Adjuster II Express Claims PC,  
Singapore– Auto Express & FNOL 
Auto Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
Tel 8001206556 | Ext: 1002210 

Xianyu.Low@aig.com | www.aig.com 
 
 

From: Low, Xianyu  
Sent: Thursday, March 4, 2021 9:12 AM 
To: chewht@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>; Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>; 
Subramaniam, Divyashni <Divyashni.Subramaniam@aig.com>; Teo, Ericweihong <Ericweihong.Teo@aig.com>; Lee, 
Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Subject: aigencrypt RE: [EXTERNAL] 9678518214SG 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
Kindly be informed that claim officer – Ming Yao has been assigned for this case in Merimen. 
 
Noticed that there is another TP claim created by FTA, kindly assist to confirm if there is a change in TP workshop. 
Thank you. 
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Thanks & Regards, 
 
Low Xian Yu 
AIG 
Adjuster II Express Claims PC,  
Singapore– Auto Express & FNOL 
Auto Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
Tel 8001206556 | Ext: 1002210 

Xianyu.Low@aig.com | www.aig.com 
 

From: Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>  
Sent: Thursday, March 4, 2021 7:40 AM 
To: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>; Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>; 
Subramaniam, Divyashni <Divyashni.Subramaniam@aig.com>; Teo, Ericweihong <Ericweihong.Teo@aig.com>; Low, 
Xianyu <Xianyu.Low@aig.com> 
Cc: chewht@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] 9678518214SG 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

This mail is associated with : 
*SLS2036S (9678518214SG) 

[SML7107M] 
TP 

GAJBE VIRENDRAPRAKASH 
Feb 20 2021 12:00PM 

 
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd - Alexandra 

Hi All, 
  
Kindly assist to indicate/update the name of AIG claim officer in Merimen. 
  
Thanks. 
  
Hsiao Tong 
 
 
This is an auto-generated email. Do not reply to this email.  
 
Sent by : CHEW HSIAO TONG (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)  


