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Re: REQUEST FINALISED FOR SMH 7584P TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT
DOA 25.02.2021

Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Wed 27/10/2021 4:13 PM
To:  Marcus Teo <marcus@apautosg.com>
Cc:  Juliana . Cc <juliana@apautomotive.services>; Admin AP Automotive Services <mota@apautomotive.services>; Work
<chrystia@apautomotive.services>; AP Automotive Services Teo <info@apautosg.com>

Hi Marcus,

thank you for your confirmation.

please submit your LOD directly to insurance company

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Marcus Teo <marcus@apautosg.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 October 2021 4:09 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Juliana . Cc <juliana@apautomotive.services>; Admin AP Automotive Services
<mota@apautomotive.services>; Work <chrystia@apautomotive.services>; AP Automotive Services Teo
<info@apautosg.com>

Subject: Re: REQUEST FINALISED FOR SMH 7584P TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT DOA 25.02.2021
 
Without Prejudice


Dear Denise, 

Nice to e-meet you 
We accept the finalization of SMH 7584P at $5500 and 7 repair days as stated in your email with
deep gratitude. 
Our team will be processing the LOD for submission shortly. 

Thank you and I wish you , Taufikh and all at LKK a well-lived life always. 

Marcus
Marcus Teo 
Chief Financial Officer
AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd
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(65) 6784 4465 | (65) 9732 4131

marcus@apautosg.com

www.apautosg.com

BLK 9006 TAMPINES ST 93 #01-202 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A , UEN:202022890H

On Tue, Oct 26, 2021 at 12:23 PM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Marcus,


Please let us know if can close at $5500,7days?


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)






From: John Ong <john@apautomotive.services>

Sent: Monday, 25 October 2021 3:37 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Marcus Teo <marcus@apautosg.com>

Cc: Admin AP Automotive Services <mota@apautomotive.services>
Subject: Re: REQUEST FINALISED FOR SMH 7584P TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT DOA 25.02.2021
 
Dear all,


Marcus will take over the finalisation from now on.


Br, 
John Ong


On Mon, 25 Oct 2021, 15:28 Denise Tay (LKKAuto), <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:


Dear John,

We have not heard from you on the confirmation.

Can close at $5500,7days?


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 21 October 2021 3:54:07 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; 'John Ong' <john@apautomotive.services>

Cc: 'Admin AP Automotive Services' <mota@apautomotive.services>

Subject: Re: REQUEST FINALISED FOR SMH 7584P TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT DOA
25.02.2021


Dear john,

Can close at $5500,7days?


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 8:30 am

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; 'John Ong' <john@apautomotive.services>

Cc: 'Admin AP Automotive Services' <mota@apautomotive.services>

Subject: Re: REQUEST FINALISED FOR SMH 7584P TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT DOA 25.02.2021
 
Dear john,

Can close at $5500,7days?

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 14 October 2021 10:35 pm

To: 'John Ong' <john@apautomotive.services>

Cc: 'Admin AP Automotive Services' <mota@apautomotive.services>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
<denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FINALISED FOR SMH 7584P TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT DOA 25.02.2021
 
Hi John,
 
My Calculation for SN is correct, can close at COR l/s$5500 , 7 days.

mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com
mailto:Taufikh@lkkauto.com
mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com
mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com
mailto:Taufikh@lkkauto.com
mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com
mailto:Taufikh@lkkauto.com
mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com


10/27/21, 4:13 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQkAGNlMTQ1ODBhLTc0NjYtNGE3OC05NWVkLTMyZWUwMGFhNWIxNAAQALYxUrmnMcFJjzYWOmF66… 4/5

 
Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto
 
 
From: John Ong [mailto:john@apautomotive.services] 

Sent: Thursday, 7 October 2021 2:55 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin AP Automotive Services; Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: REQUEST FINALISED FOR SMH 7584P TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT DOA
25.02.2021
 
DEar Taufikh, 
 
Your S/N calculation is incorrect. 
 
Br, 
John 
 
On Thu, 7 Oct 2021 at 13:02, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,
 
Please refer attached, COR l/s$5500 , 7 days.
 
Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto
 

From: Admin AP Automotive Services [mailto:mota@apautomotive.services] 

Sent: Thursday, 11 March 2021 12:43 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Juliana .; Paul Ho; John Ong; Chrystia Liew; Nic Chia

Subject: REQUEST FINALISED FOR SMH 7584P TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT DOA
25.02.2021
 
Hi Sir / Madam
 
Attached after paint photos as requested
 
We seek your kind help if you could finalize the vehicle.
 
Looking forward to hear from you soon.
 

No Vehicle Number Make / Model DOA Estimate Finalised Surveyor
             

1 SMH 7584P
 TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS

CLASSIC 1.6 CVT   25.02.2021  $19,516.89   $6,100.00 TAUFIKH 
             
 
Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries thereof.
Best regards,
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Zaleha
AP Automotive  Services Pte Ltd
ROC: 202022890H
BLK 9006 TAMPINES ST 93
#01-202 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A
SINGAPORE 528840
TEL: 6784 4465   FAX: 6787 4886 
 
 


