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Re: Our Ref: SLL8060T ; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 180E(AIG) ON 09/02/2021] LKK REF
: CC4/AIG21002643/Kps3

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Thu 14/10/2021 9:48 AM
To:  Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email.

Our insured was driving straight slowly and he did not stop as alleged. From the video, it shows that your client
front right wheel had swerved right and collided onto our insured vehicle.

We regret to inform you that we maintain our position as per email dated 06 Oct 2021.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed

/ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 7 October 2021 10:54 am

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: SLL8060T ; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 180E(AIG) ON 09/02/2021] LKK REF :
CC4/AIG21002643/Kps3
 
Dear Hsiao Tong,
 
Before the impact, our client was in front of your insured. Your insured stop but suddenly move off again which
causes the accident.
 
Nevertheless both parties is at fault for this accident, we propose 50-50 to settle this claim.
 
 
Thanks & Regards,

Kelly
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Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,

Ave 5 #01-15 , 16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint

Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 October 2021 3:23 PM

To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3)

Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: Our Ref: SLL8060T ; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 180E(AIG) ON 09/02/2021] LKK REF :
CC4/AIG21002643/Kps3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
Attached is a copy of our insured video footage for your easy reference. Both vehicles were travelling on the
same lane and our insured was ahead of your client vehicle, then your client was coming from behind, swerved
right and collided onto our insured vehicle. Our insured insisted that he is not liable for this accident.
 
In view of this, we regret to inform you that we are unable to look into your client's claim.
 
Thank you.
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed

/ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 September 2021 2:39 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: SLL8060T ; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 180E(AIG) ON 09/02/2021] LKK REF :
CC4/AIG21002643/Kps3
 
Dear Hsiao Tong,
 
 
We don’t have video, but scene photos was clearly show that our client fully in the lane & that your insured hit
his rear.
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Thanks & Regards,

Kelly


Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,

Ave 5 #01-15 , 16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint

Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465
 
From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 August 2021 4:09 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; chewgoon@singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: Our Ref: SLL8060T ; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 180E(AIG) ON 09/02/2021] LKK REF :
CC4/AIG21002643/Kps3
 
Dear Hsiao Tong,
 
Any news for this claim?
 
 
Thanks & Regards,

Kelly


Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,

Ave 5 #01-15 , 16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint

Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465
 

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3)

Sent: Wednesday, 14 July 2021 3:07 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Our Ref: SLL8060T ; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 180E(AIG) ON 09/02/2021] LKK REF :
CC4/AIG21002643/Kps3
 
Dear Hsiao Tong,
 
According to attached scene photo, our client was fully in the lane & that your insured hit his rear.
 
 
Thanks & Regards,

Kelly


Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,

Ave 5 #01-15 , 16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint

Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465

mailto:ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewgoon@singnet.com.sg
mailto:ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com


10/14/21, 9:49 AM Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMkAGU0ZDViNzgxLWE5MTItNDkxMi1hZWIxLTA3MjhlMTA0N2RiNgBGAAAAAADl7f6wE2MfQpF%… 4/5

 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 12 July 2021 5:25 PM

To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3)

Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Our Ref: SLL8060T ; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 180E(AIG) ON 09/02/2021] LKK REF :
CC4/AIG21002643/Kps3
 
Without Prejudice
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy
reference.
 
We would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our necessary action.
 
Appreciate an early reply.
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed
/ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 7 July 2021 4:31 PM

To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: Our Ref: SLL8060T ; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 180E(AIG) ON 09/02/2021] LKK REF :
CC4/AIG21002643/Kps3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
 
Hi Hsiao Tong,
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FYNA, CC4/AIG21002643/Kps3
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
 
 
*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
 Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.
                                                              
Thank you.
Best Regards,
Su Li| Admin Support
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
 

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, July 7, 2021 4:12 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Our Ref: SLL8060T ; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 180E(AIG) ON 09/02/2021]
 
Dear Sir / Madam,
 
Kindly refer to the attached LOD.
 
 
Thanks & Regards,

Kelly


Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,

Ave 5 #01-15 , 16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint

Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465
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