Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 12:26 PM

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Taxis); aquaristdomain@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident on 19/2/2021 involving SHC 4725E & SLX 8507J along Pasir Panjang
Rd (Our Ref: TAX/02/21/2047/Ig)

Attachments: 1388_001.pdf

Hi Me Lee Gek,

Thank you for your email.
Hi Mr Soon,

Please find below our bank details for survey fee:-

Name of Bank Account LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Name of Bank uoB
Bank — Branch No. 7375 - 016
Account No. 116-311-126-3
Email address for remittance advice account@lkkauto.com
PAYNOW ID 199607198R002
Thanks.
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 11:40 AM

To: aquaristdomain@gmail.com

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident on 19/2/2021 involving SHC 4725E & SLX 8507J along Pasir Panjang Rd (Our Ref:
TAX/02/21/2047/\g)

Dear Mr Soon,

We refer to your proposal for a private settlement on 22/2/2021.



As spoken today, you agreed to settle our claim at $1,258.25 plus survey fee of $267.50 as follows:-

Cost of Repair $850.00
Loss of Rental $401.25 ( 3 daysx S$133.75 )
LTA Search Fee $7.00
Survey Fee $267.50
Total $1525.75

We attach the proof of rental and accident vehicle laid-up report for your perusal. As the repair costs is just finalised
today, we will email to you our final repair bill when it is ready.

For mode of payment:-

1) $1,258.25 to be paid to SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD;
2) $267.50 (5250.00 + GST) to be paid to LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Our bank details is as follows:-

Account Name SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD

Account Number 018-008271-3

Bank Name DBS Bank Ltd

Bank & Branch Code Bank No. 7171 / Branch Code: 018

Please let us have the transaction receipt when payment is made so that we can verify with our finance dept and
will forward you the Mutual Settlement.

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Please provide the bank details for payment of your survey fee. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@smnr

AUTOMODTIVE




