Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 27 May 2022 9:20 AM
To: ‘ngs motorsport'

Subject: RE: Our Insured veh SJZ245E
Attachments: DV_SJZ245E.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: ngs motorsport <ngsmotorsportpteltd@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 26 May 2022 1:09 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Our Insured veh SJZ245E

Ok, confirm.

Evelyn Ng
DID HP 9695 5547

NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2a
#02-01 AMK AutoPoint
Singapore 568047



On Thu, May 26, 2022 at 12:58 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Apologised for late response.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $950.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)



From: ngs motorsport <ngsmotorsportpteltd@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 18 May 2022 10:47 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Our Insured veh SJZ245E

Noted with thanks.

Evelyn Ng

DID HP 9695 5547

NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2a
#02-01 AMK AutoPoint

Singapore 568047

On Tue, May 17, 2022 at 11:53 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that Il had written to our insured for this matter and will get back an update by this week.

Kindly hold hands for time being.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 May 2022 9:12 AM

To: ngs motorsport <ngsmotorsportpteltd@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: Our Insured veh SJZ245E

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,

We are seeking further mandate/instruction from our principal.

We will follow up and get back to you by end of this week.

Kindly hold hands for time being.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: ngs motorsport <ngsmotorsportpteltd@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 1 April 2022 11:57 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Our Insured veh SJZ245E

Hi Hsiao Tong,

As spoken to you on 17/3/22.

We have yet to hear from you till today.



If you wish to settle the matter, our client's claim is set out hereunder:-

a) Cost of Repair S 850.00
b) LOU 3days @560.00 S 180.00 (Include Survey)

¢) LTA Search S 7.45
Total $1037.45

Please let us have your early reply within 7 days, failing which our clients will proceed with legal action.

Regards,

Evelyn Ng

DID HP 9695 5547

NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2a
#02-01 AMK AutoPoint

Singapore 568047



