Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, October 12, 2021 4:39 PM

To: 'Gerald - Ah Lim Motor SM'; Admin A

Cc: ‘MeiLi Tan - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming'

Subject: RE: Checking Liability : Survey Vehicle SMG8562B ACC: 19/02/2021 13:40
Categories: HMK

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Gerald,
Kindly advice if your client still pursuing the matter.

Based on our surveyor comments, he has yet to receive any calls from your end for resurvey and did not being inform if
car has been repaired.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

57424
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From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 2 March 2021 1:34 PM

To: Gerald - Ah Lim Motor SM <gerald@almsm.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: Meili Tan - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming <meili@almsm.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Checking Liability : Survey Vehicle SMG8562B ACC: 19/02/2021 13:40

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Gerald,

We have review and investigate the matter.

The liability is clear. (only the rear portion) — BOLA S27

As based on video footage, Our Insured is not the caused for the chain collision.

Your client has rear ended the 3 vehicle infront of his vehicle before Our insured rear ended you client’s
vehicle.

In view of above, we are only liable to the rear portion damage of your client’s vehicle.

Thanks

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@]lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

57474
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From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 2 March 2021 9:14 AM

To: Gerald - Ah Lim Motor SM <gerald@almsm.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: Meili Tan - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming <meili@almsm.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Checking Liability : Survey Vehicle SMG8562B ACC: 19/02/2021 13:40

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Gerald,

Kindly provide longer version of footage of before collision till collision meet.
The attached footage did not show any collision meet thereafter.

You may want to whatsapp to me if file size too big at 8891 1278.

Thanks

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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ReERER W Syve the Larth Print only when necessary-

From: Gerald - Ah Lim Motor SM [mailto:gerald@almsm.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 1 March 2021 5:42 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team
<cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Meili Tan - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming <meili@almsm.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Checking Liability : Survey Vehicle SMG8562B ACC: 19/02/2021 13:40

Dear Cecilia,
As requested.
Best Regards,

Gerald - (Sin Ming)

176 Sin Ming Drive

#05-12 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore 575721

Tel : 6456 3637 Fax: 6456 3686

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, March 01, 2021 1:15 PM

To: Gerald - Ah Lim Motor SM ; Admin-D (LKKAuto) ; CS A Team ; Admin A

Cc: assignments ; mailto:meili@almsm.com.sg

Subject: RE: Checking Liability : Survey Vehicle SMG8562B ACC: 19/02/2021 13:40

Without Prejudice

Dear Gerald,

Our principal would like to request for a longer video footage to determine the chain sequence.
Kindly furnish us a copy.

Thanks

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Gerald - Ah Lim Motor SM [mailto:gerald@almsm.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 25 February 2021 2:12 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team
<cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Meili Tan - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming <meili@almsm.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Checking Liability : Survey Vehicle SMG8562B ACC: 19/02/2021 13:40

Dear Cecilia,
As requested, accident video for your reference.
Best Regards,

Gerald - (Sin Ming)

176 Sin Ming Drive

#05-12 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore 575721

Tel : 6456 3637 Fax: 6456 3686

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, February 25, 2021 1:49 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) ; Gerald - Ah Lim Motor SM ; CS A Team ; Admin A

Cc: assignments ; mailto:meili@almsm.com.sg

Subject: RE: Checking Liability : Survey Vehicle SMG8562B ACC: 19/02/2021 13:40

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Gerald,
We refer to the above matter.

The liability is unclear. (your client reported that he not able to stop in time and hit onto vehicle C before our
insured rear ended your client vehicle)

Kindly provide us with video footage to review the liability.
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Thanks

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 February 2021 11:21 AM

To: Gerald - Ah Lim Motor SM <gerald@almsm.com.sg>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>; CS A
Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Meili Tan - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming <meili@almsm.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Checking Liability : Survey Vehicle SMG8562B ACC: 19/02/2021 13:40

Dear Gerald,
Thank you for the email.
Dear Cecilia,
Kindly assist.

FYNA Our Ref : CC4/A1G21002520/ga3

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

From: Gerald - Ah Lim Motor SM <gerald@almsm.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 February 2021 11:17 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; MeiLi Tan - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming <meili@almsm.com.sg>
Subject: Checking Liability : Survey Vehicle SMG8562B ACC: 19/02/2021 13:40

Dear Summer,

We refer to the attached Marked Estimate on our client’s vehicle SMG8562B conducted by surveyor Mr
Kenneth Kong.

Kindly assist to advise back on the liability.

Best Regards,



Gerald - (Sin Ming)

176 Sin Ming Drive

#05-12 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore 575721

Tel : 6456 3637 Fax: 6456 3686

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, February 23, 2021 3:36 PM
To: Gerald - Ah Lim Motor SM

Cc: assignments
Subject: Re: Survey Vehicle SMG8562B

Dear Gerald,
Noted with thanks.

Will Survey after 9a.m thanks.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| S(408933)

From: Gerald - Ah Lim Motor SM <gerald@almsm.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 23 February 2021 3:33 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Survey Vehicle SMG8562B

Dear LKK,

The vehicle is not at our workshop at the moment, the owner will sent his vehicle to our workshop on this
Thursday at 9am.

Best Regards,
Gerald - (Sin Ming)

176 Sin Ming Drive
#05-12 Sin Ming Autocare



Singapore 575721
Tel : 6456 3637 Fax: 6456 3686

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, February 23, 2021 1:53 PM
To: Gerald - Ah Lim Motor SM

Cc: assignments
Subject: Survey Vehicle SMG8562B

Dear Gerald,

Is the vehicle SMG 8562B in the workshop?

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| S(408933)




