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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept <claims_ltr@bifrostauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 8 April 2021 11:19 AM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Claims Dept; Claims Dept; Joseph Koh

Subject: Re: SGV 580 T - FInalization Acceptance

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Kenneth,  
 

Thank you for your offer dated 7 Apr 2021, 18:06. 
 

We accept your offer PBP $800 / 3days.   
 

We will issue LOD to MSIG shortly 

 

Regards, 

  

Miss Leong 

Bifrost Auto Pte Ltd 

Accident Claims Dept 

 

On Wed, 7 Apr 2021 at 18:06, Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

$800.00 confirmed. 

  

From: Claims Dept <claims_ltr@bifrostauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 7 April 2021 4:32 pm 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Claims Dept <claims_ltv@bifrostauto.com>; Claims Dept <claims_ltm@bifrostauto.com>; Joseph Koh 

<joseph.koh@bifrostauto.com> 

Subject: SGV 580 T - FInalization 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Kenneth,  
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Please find the attached after paint photo and finalization repair for your kind perusal. 

  

We hope you can finalise at PBP $800 / 3days.  

  

Hope to hear from you soon. 

  

  

Regards, 

  

Miss Leong 

Bifrost Auto Pte Ltd 

Accident Claims Dept 


