Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Xin Yun Auto <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 22 April 2021 3:05 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SMK8659K PD-XIN YUN AUTO

Dear all, please proceed to close this case, thank you.

Best regards,

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto

Tel/Fax:6634 0858

Mobile: 9839 1555
Email:xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Fri, Apr 16, 2021 at 12:28 PM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Yi Xin,

Refer attached COR 1/s$4300, 5 days.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Xin Yun Auto [mailto:xinyunautol@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 16 April 2021 11:24 AM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com

Subject: Fwd: SMK8659K PD-XIN YUN AUTO

Dear Taufikh, fyi...

Please refer to attached GIA, thank you.

Best Regards,

Yi Xin



Xin Yun Auto

Tel/Fax:6634 0858

Mobile: 9839 1555

Email:xinyunautol@gmail.com




