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Re: SLU 5643J / III TP CASEDOA: 13/02/2021

PKS Claims <admin@pksautomotive.com>
Mon 12/7/2021 1:58 PM
To:  Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Hi Denise,

$16,000/- is accepted.

Thank you & Best Regards,

Sharon Ong
(Senior Executive)

PKS AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
7 Toh Guan Road East
Alpha Industrial Building
#04-11 Singapore 608599

On Mon, Jul 5, 2021 at 4:40 PM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Sharon,


Max $16,000/- Please consider.






Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: PKS Claims <admin@pksautomotive.com>

Sent: Monday, 5 July 2021 4:31 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLU 5643J / III TP CASEDOA: 13/02/2021
 
Hi Denise,


We would like to finalise at $17,000/-




Thank you & Best Regards,

Sharon Ong
(Senior Executive)


PKS AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
7 Toh Guan Road East
Alpha Industrial Building
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#04-11 Singapore 608599




On Wed, Jun 30, 2021 at 2:46 PM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:


Hi,

 

Would like to finalise this case

 

Offer at lump sum $15,000/-

 

 

 

 

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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