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Re: After repaired photos- SFK9850A

AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>
Thu 24/6/2021 5:54 PM
To:  Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Hi Denise
We confirm to accept COR $5000 before GST and 5 days repair.

Thank you.

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd

Mailing Address: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898

Workshop Address: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933

Tel: 91198371  www.aimgarage.com.sg


On Thu, Jun 24, 2021 at 9:41 AM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,


Can we confirm?


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)






From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 June 2021 8:51 AM

To: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: After repaired photos- SFK9850A
 
Dear Jacyne,


Please confirm


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 21 June 2021 3:57 PM

To: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: After repaired photos- SFK9850A
 
Hi Jacyne,
 
Finalize COR $5000 before GST @ 5 days.  
 
Regards,
Guo Qiang
 
 
From: AIM PTE LTD [mailto:automim.claim@gmail.com] 

Sent: Monday, 19 April, 2021 3:23 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: After repaired photos- SFK9850A
 
Hi, 
 
Can please advise the settlement for this?
 
Thanks
 
Regards, 
Jacyne 


Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)
Office: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898
W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933
Tel: 91198371
 
 
On Wed, Mar 17, 2021 at 12:53 PM AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Guo Qiang, 
 
Any update on this? Please advise
 
Thank you
 
Regards, 
Jacyne 



Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)
Office: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898
W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933
Tel: 91198371
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On Tue, Mar 9, 2021 at 11:57 AM AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Guo Qiang, 
 
Please find attached after repaired photos and kindly advise the offer
 
Thank you
 
Regards, 
Jacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)
Office: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898
W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933
Tel: 91198371
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