
RE: Vehicle inspection - D/20200812/0100

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Thu 18/2/2021 5:23 PM
To:  Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Dear Sherwin,
 
You can search the above case as VOLKSWAGEN JETTA in our system.
 
Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 18 February 2021 4:48 PM 
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Fw: Vehicle inspec�on - D/20200812/0100
 
Hello Shiau Chan
 
Can you open this case under me. 
 
This is their Ref No. D/20200812/0100
 
Best Regards,
Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator
LKK Auto Consultants
Office: 6256 3561  | Email:  SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)
 
 

From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) 
Sent: Tuesday, 16 February 2021 4:07 PM 
To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Hui Min TAN (SPF) <TAN_Hui_Min@spf.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle inspec�on - D/20200812/0100
 
Hello IO Hui Min and Bryan
 
The Inspec�on �ming has been fixed on 17/2/2021 5pm @ Clemen� Division.
 
Best Regards,
Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator
LKK Auto Consultants
Office: 6256 3561  | Email:  SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)
 
 

mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com
mailto:%C2%A0SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com
mailto:bryanang@lkkauto.com
mailto:TAN_Hui_Min@spf.gov.sg
mailto:%C2%A0SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com


From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 16 February 2021 2:49 pm 
To: Hui Min TAN (SPF) <TAN_Hui_Min@spf.gov.sg> 
Cc: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle inspec�on - D/20200812/0100
 
Hi Sherwin
 
Can you check your schedule for this Thursday and liaise with IO Hui Min on the inspection.
 
Best Regards,
Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Hui Min TAN (SPF) <TAN_Hui_Min@spf.gov.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 16 February 2021 1:52 PM 
To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle inspec�on - D/20200812/0100
 
Dear Bryan,
 
              I have obtained the approval for vehicle inspec�on. May I check if your company is able to conduct the
check this Thursday, 18/02/2021?
 
Best regards,
 
Tan Hui Min (Ms) 
Investigation Officer
Clementi Division (GIS 6)
DID: 6872 8890 | Fax: 6872 7264
 

     
Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce

 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must
not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized
person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error.
 
From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 29 December 2020 2:28 pm 
To: Hui Min TAN (SPF) <TAN_Hui_Min@spf.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle inspec�on - D/20200812/0100
 
Dear IO Hui Min
 
The price for towing the vehicle will be in the range of $80 to $130 per trip depending on the difficulty.
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Best Regards,
Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
From: Hui Min TAN (SPF) <TAN_Hui_Min@spf.gov.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 29 December 2020 2:20 PM 
To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle inspec�on - D/20200812/0100
 
Dear Bryan,
 
              Thank you so much for your reply. May I check with you on the price of towing if needed?
 
 
Best regards,
 

Tan Hui Min (Ms) 
Investigation Officer
Clementi Division (GIS 6)
Singapore Police Force
DID: 6872 8890 | Fax: 6872 7264
 

Singapore Police Force – Commemorating 200 Years of Policing   
 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you
are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, distribute or take any action in
reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized
person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender
immediately if you receive this in error."
 

 

 

 
 

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 29 December 2020 10:27 AM 
To: Hui Min TAN (SPF) <TAN_Hui_Min@spf.gov.sg> 
Cc: Keong Chye YEO (SPF) <YEO_Keong_Chye@spf.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle inspec�on - D/20200812/0100
 
Dear IO Hui Min
 
The quote provided in my email dated 07 Oct remains. There is no expiry to this quote.
 
We will do a static inspection first and if any abnormality found, we will advise further steps/actions for
your consideration.

mailto:bryanang@lkkauto.com
mailto:TAN_Hui_Min@spf.gov.sg
mailto:bryanang@lkkauto.com
http://www.police.gov.sg/
mailto:bryanang@lkkauto.com
mailto:TAN_Hui_Min@spf.gov.sg
mailto:YEO_Keong_Chye@spf.gov.sg


 
Best Regards,
Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
From: Hui Min TAN (SPF) <TAN_Hui_Min@spf.gov.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 29 December 2020 9:11 AM 
To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Keong Chye YEO (SPF) <YEO_Keong_Chye@spf.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle inspec�on - D/20200812/0100
 
Dear Sir,
 
              I refer to the quota�on you provided on 07/10/2020. May I check the quote valid period for the
men�oned quota�on?
 
2.           Addi�onally, I am unable to allow your technician to test drive the vehicle. Therefore, I would like the
inspec�on to be based solely on sta�c tests and observa�on.
 
3.           Feel free to contact me for further queries.
 
4.           Thank you.
 
Best regards,
 

Tan Hui Min (Ms) 
Investigation Officer
Clementi Division (GIS 6)
Singapore Police Force
DID: 6872 8890 | Fax: 6872 7264
 

Singapore Police Force – Commemorating 200 Years of Policing   
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From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 7 October 2020 3:38 PM 
To: Hui Min TAN (SPF) <TAN_Hui_Min@spf.gov.sg> 
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Cc: Keong Chye YEO (SPF) <YEO_Keong_Chye@spf.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: Vehicle inspec�on - D/20200812/0100
 
Dear IO Hui Min 

I refer to your email below.
 
We can carry out a mechanical inspection of the subject vehicle to check whether there is any
abnormality to its steering system and braking system, tyre condition etc. We will also carry out a short
drive within your car park to check on the operating condition of its steering system and braking system.
The test drive is subject to the physical condition of the vehicle like for example if there are severe
damage that render the vehicle non-driveable, then the inspection will be based solely on static tests
and observations. Thereafter, we will put up a written report with photos of our findings for your follow
up.
 
Our fees for such inspection is $550/- excluding gst.
 
Best Regards,
Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
From: Hui Min TAN (SPF) <TAN_Hui_Min@spf.gov.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 29 September 2020 4:18 PM 
To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Keong Chye YEO (SPF) <YEO_Keong_Chye@spf.gov.sg> 
Subject: Vehicle inspec�on - D/20200812/0100
 
Dear Sir,
 
              This is Inves�ga�on Officer Tan Hui Min from Clemen� Police Division. I am currently inves�ga�ng into a
case of Rash Act Causing Hurt vide the abovemen�oned incident number. The case involved one motor vehicle
(Volkswagen Je�a).
 
2            I would like to have a quota�on for the following services:

a. Servicing of both hand brake and foot brake
b. Towing services from Clemen� Police Division to workshop (if needed)
c. Towing services from workshop back to police compound

 
3            I would like to have a copy of the vehicle assessment report therea�er.
 
4            Feel free to contact me at 6872 8890 for any queries.
 
5            Thank you.
 
Best regards,
 

Tan Hui Min (Ms) 
Investigation Officer
Clementi Division (GIS 6)
Singapore Police Force
DID: 6872 8890 | Fax: 6872 7264
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