Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 April 2021 10:58 AM

To: nabilah@mova.com.sg

Subject: <STANDARD NOTIFICATION LETTER> OUR REF: CC4/AIG21002329/Uga3 ***

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 9550R & SMT 8152H ON 11/02/2021 ***

Our Ref: CC4/A1G21002329/Uga3
28 APRIL 2021

MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
DRIVER: MOHAMAD AQIL SYAHREKI AHMAD MAHAMOD

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 9550R & SMT 8152H ON 11/02/2021

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your Motor Insurer
(AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SMT 8152H.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

c.c AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 67494274 | email: CeciliaChong@(kKauto.com | fax; 67414108

BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)
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6/22/2021 Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SMT8152H (1001925435SG)
[GBA9550R]
TP
GOH YONG KANG
Feb 11 2021 7:00PM
[MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD]
Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 16/06/2021 14:10 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SMT8152H - Claim Handler: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Maintained:HI, PLEASE TAKE NOTE WE HAVE REPUDIATE ALL CLAIMS TO INSURED UNDER THE TERMS & CONDITION ON THE MOTOR POLICY. PLS FOLLOW-UP
NECESSSARY UPDATE TO TP ETC.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=85519039& CFTOKEN=c639efe6285ea2a4-EAD25D61-A2C9-12F5-2A9BF5C9220505BC&USID=9765&RID=40451... 1/1



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 21 June 2021 1:46 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: YOUR REF: SMT 8152H (OUR REF: CC4/A1G21002329/Uga3) *** ACCIDENT
INVOLVING GBA 9550R & SMT 8152H ON 11/02/2021 ***

Attachments: image001.jpg

Dear Cecilia,
Please withdraw this claim.

On Tue, May 25, 2021, 10:38 Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@]lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Elin,

We are in the process to generate report to seek mandate.

Will revert back to you in due course.

Thanks

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chonyg | Case Handler

LXK Auto Consultants Pte Lid



