Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: t n b motor <tbmotor@hotmail.sg>

Sent: Friday, 26 March 2021 1:48 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your ref : GBB 7087U / DOA : 11/02/2021
Attachments: Claim Documents_GBB7087U(26Mar2021).pdf

Dear Jasper,

Pls proceed to do direct settlement, Kindly refer to attached for the claim supporting documents.
thanks

Best Regards,
Judy Ong

T & B Motor Repairs Services Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive #08-03

Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel:6454 8007 / 6458 0296

Fax:6554 2640

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, March 26, 2021 11:09 AM

To: tbmotor@hotmail.sg <tbmotor@hotmail.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Your ref : GBB 7087U / DOA : 11/02/2021

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Liability is clear.

Kindly advise whether proceed to do direct settlement with our principal.
Thanks

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



