


BLK 167A PUNGGOL EAST SERVICE ROAD 10/02/2021

SMM 7691L

SMM 7691L AND SLJ 9502P

LIM CHYE MONG SXXXX997E

SMM 7691L

LIM CHYE MONG

SMM 7691L

SXXXX997E

29 ELIAS ROAD #05-19 S519933







Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 17 Feb 2021 / 09:53:19

Receipt Date/Time : 17 Feb 2021 / 09:53:18

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-210217-000655

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference 
No.

Amount 
Before

GST (S$)

GST 
Amount 

(S$)

Amount 
After GST 

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SLJ9502P
As at 10 Feb 2021/18:00:00
Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

1 Insurance Enquiry - SLJ9502P
Enquiry Fee 
20210217095111911116

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SLM6628P
As at 26 Jan 2021/15:50:00
Insurance Co: NTUC INCOME INS CO-OP LTD

2 Insurance Enquiry - SLM6628P
Enquiry Fee 
20210217095112004897

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 14.00 0.98 14.98

Rounding Difference 0.03

Total Amount Payable 14.95

Paid By

558860XXXXXX3958 eNETS Credit Card 14.95

Total 14.95

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 14.95

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service 
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee 

may apply.



1

Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Annie <annieloh@popularcar.com>
Sent: Friday, 9 July 2021 9:02 AM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM 7691L AND SLJ 9502P ON THE 10/02/2021

Hi Jasper, 
 
Noted with thanks.  
 

Regards,  

Annie Loh 
Assistant Manager 
Popular Rent A Car Pte Ltd 
501 Guillemard Road, Singapore 399840 
Tel: 6742 8888  
Fax: 6743 3003 
  
WhizzCar - Wheels on Demand since 2003 
Giving you 24-hour access to over 130 cars in more than 50 locations islandwide 
www.whizzcar.com 
  
Popular Rent A Car - Smooth rides and peace of mind since 1996 
Personal and Corporate Rentals • Chauffeur Service 
www.popularcar.com 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) [mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, July 8, 2021 1:39 PM 
To: INFO@POPULARCAR.COM 
Cc: SUAIDI@SPH.COM.SG 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM 7691L AND SLJ 9502P ON THE 10/02/2021 
 
Our Ref: CC6/AIG21002277/Aba3                                                          
 
08 JULY 2021                                                                       
                                                                 
POPULAR RENT A CAR PTE LTD 
Driver : SUAIDI BIN MASWARI 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM 7691L AND SLJ 9502P ON THE 10/02/2021 
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against 
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized driver may 
not be absolved from blame for this accident. 
 
If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in 
writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 18/07/2021, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant 
on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against 
the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident. 
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Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial 
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will 
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 




