Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 31 August 2021 5:21 pm

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: k2% FINALISED FOR SKU 977R HYUNDAI VELOSTER FS 1.6 T-GDI GLS DOA
10.02.2021

R4 A: Admin AP Automotive Services <mota@apautomotive.services>

S Ri%: 2021 4£ 8 A 31 H 17:20:49 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

ek A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

$i%: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Juliana . <juliana@apautomotive.services>; John Ong
<john@apautomotive.services>; Paul Ho <paul@apautomotive.services>

FE&i: Re: FINALISED FOR SKU 977R HYUNDAI VELOSTER FS 1.6 T-GDI GLS DOA 10.02.2021

Dear Guo Qiang,

We accepted your offer COR $7,600.00 before GST & 5 repair days.

Best regards,

Zaleha

AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd
ROC: 202022890H

BLK 9006 TAMPINES ST 93

#01-202 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A
SINGAPORE 528840

TEL: 6784 4465 FAX: 6787 4886

On Mon, 30 Aug 2021 at 11:53, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Zaleha,

Finalize COR $7600 before GST @ 5 days.
COR subject to insurance approval.

Regards,
Guo Qiang



