Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Hi Sun Pin,
Ok agreed

Thanks < regards,

Bernard
Hp: 91018302

EM Auto <emautosolution@singnet.com.sg>
Wednesday, 28 April 2021 9:58 AM

Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

RE: Finalize SKH4984L

From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) [mailto:sunpin@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 27 April, 2021 9:57 AM

To: emautosolution@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Finalize SKH4984L

Hi Bernard,

Kindly refer the finalize amount $2,200. Repair day 4 days. (L/S, before gst).

Please confirm the COR by reply email.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




