Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Isaac Ng Cheng Long <lsaacNgCL@gbl.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 1 March 2021 7:27 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: : Nick NG (DHL SG; Jeremy Teo Jia He (DHL SG; Ethan Toh Xiao Xin; Keith Tan Jing
Feng

Subject: RE: Accident involving GBC6722X on 15/02/2021

Hi Cecilia,

This unit is insured under MS FCIL and leased to our hirer Prospect Logistics Pte Ltd.
Thanks

Regards,

GOLD BELL Goldbell Leasing Pte thd

soome L E A S I N G

Industrial Vehicles. Financial Services. +65 6494 2897 | m: +65 9829 8836 | f: +65 6864 0625 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg
41,000 Served. And Counting.

Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator

PLEASE BE REMINDED:

) 5
4
Using GOODS VEHICLE as a PUBLIC SERVICE VEHICLE m‘ _-

and COLLECTING FARE without an official licence - o
is NOT allowed by LTA. Thank you! = 9 n_

THE STRATTS TIVES

Singapore's Our Goldbell family has always been our greatest asset
Best Employers We want to thank our colleagues for their contribution over the years

m and making us one of the top employers in Singapore.

From: Keith Tan Jing Feng <KeithTanJF@gbl.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 February 2021 3:36 pm

To: Isaac Ng Cheng Long <lIsaacNgCL@gbl.com.sg>; Ethan Toh Xiao Xin <EthanTohXX@gbl.com.sg>
Cc: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com; : Nick NG (DHL SG <nick.ng@dhl.com>; Jeremy Teo Jia He (DHL SG
<Jeremy.Teo@dhl.com>

Subject: FW: Accident involving GBC6722X on 15/02/2021

Importance: High

Hi Isaac / Ethan,

Can you help with the below. Thanks



GOLDBELL Goldbell Leasing PtelLtd

soome L E A S I N G

Industrial Vahicles. Financial Sarvices. +65 6494 2851 | m: +65 9277 2297 | f: +65 6862 4496 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg
41,000 Served. And Counting.

Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator

THE STRATTS TIVES

T Our Goldbell family has always been our greatest asset
Singapores K
Best Employers “We want to thank our colleagues for their contribution over the years

m and making us one of the top employers in Singapore.

From: Nick NG (DHL SG) <nick.ng@dhl.com>

Sent: Thursday, 25 February 2021 1:58 PM

To: Keith Tan Jing Feng <KeithTanJF@gbl.com.sg>; CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com

Cc: Nick NG (DHL SG) <nick.ng@dhl.com>; Jeremy Teo Jia He (DHL SG) <Jeremy.Teo@dhl.com>
Subject: Accident involving GBC6722X on 15/02/2021

Importance: High

Hi Keith

We received a letter form LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd appointed to act on the behalf of AlG regarding a third party
claim.

GBC6722X was return to Goldbell Leasing on the 26 Jun 2020.

Can you follow up with Cecilia Chong from LKK Auto Consultants to confirm that the said vehicle was returned.

Rgds
Nick

DHL Express - Excellence. Simply delivered.

Deutsche Post DHL Group
DHL Express (S) Pte Ltd, Singapore, Business Registration Number: 19770052427

This message is from DHL Express Singapore and may contain confidential business information. It is intended solely
for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient please contact the sender
and delete this message and any attachment from your system. Unauthorized publication, use, dissemination,
forwarding, printing or copying of this email and its attachments is strictly prohibited.

GOGREEN - Environmental protection with DHL
Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this email.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message is from DHL and may contain confidential business information. It is intended solely for
the use of the individual to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient please contact the sender and delete this
message and any attachment from your system. Unauthorized publication, use, dissemination, forwarding, printing or copying
of this E-Mail and its attachments is strictly prohibited.



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 April 2021 2:57 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Claims

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD2102-068--Accident involving GBC6722X (FCIL) & SHD5512R on

15.02.21 *** LKK REF: CC3/AlIG21002240/Kga3

Without prejudice

Dear Cecilia
Yes, we would like purchase the survey report, kindly send us your survey invoice for us to prepare payment.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the
conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 16 April, 2021 2:28 PM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Claims
<claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD2102-068--Accident involving GBC6722X (FCIL) & SHD5512R on 15.02.21 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G21002240/Kga3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Wai Yin,

As we are not able to do so in DS because FCIL does not allow. However, we can be able to sell the survey
report to you.

Do let us know if you would like to purchase the report from us.

Thanks

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



