Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 April 2021 3:39 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: slp9080h photo

Case finalised

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
¥F L7E7

RLERER W Spve the Larthe Print only whern necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 April, 2021 3:38 PM
To: Xinya Auto Services

Subject: RE: slp9080h photo

Hi Kevin,

As per our message thru watsapp, finalised amount of $ 3,900 / 5 days of repair is confirmed

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

RLERER W Syve the Larthe Print only when necessary-

From: Xinya Auto Services [mailto:xinyaauto@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Wednesday, 17 March, 2021 4:26 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: sIp9080h photo

Hi, Rasul

The door board, glass channel, door lock motor,window regulator photo show
Pls. check

Thank you
regards



From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@I|kkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, March 17, 2021 4:04 PM

To: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: sIp9080h photo

Confirm finalised

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ESL”

RLERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

From: Xinya Auto Services [mailto:xinyaauto@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Wednesday, 17 March, 2021 4:01 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: slp9080h photo

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@I|kkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, March 17, 2021 3:23 PM

To: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: sIp9080h photo

Hi,
Kindly confirm finalised and forward to me the towing receipt

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ESL”

RLERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

From: Xinya Auto Services [mailto:xinyaauto@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Wednesday, 17 March, 2021 2:43 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: sIp9080h photo

3™ batch photo



Thank you
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