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Dear Sun Pin,  
 
This vehicle SLF2998J, we will accept the offer of repair costs at $1800.00 lump sum with 3 working days.  
 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 

Jason 

ARC Executive 

6955 9331 

60 Jalan Lam Huat, 
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---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 
Date: Tue, Apr 20, 2021 at 3:24 PM 
Subject: RE: Vehicle SLF2998J, finalize repair costs 
To: Zhe Hao Lau <jasonlauzh@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
Cc: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
 

Hi Jason, 

  

Kindly refer the finalize amount $1,800. Repair day 3 days. (L/S, before gst). 

  

Please confirm the COR by reply email.  


