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转发: SJR 9162 T TOYOTA ALTIS ------FINALIZE

Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>
Fri 27/8/2021 10:51 AM
To:  SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

 

发件人: Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com>

已发送: 2021年8月27日 10:51:17 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

抄送: Rico 60 Enquiry <enquiry@rico60.com>

主题: Re: SJR 9162 T TOYOTA ALTIS ------FINALIZE


HI GUO QIANG ,

ACCEPT AND CLOSED AT  COR $4700 before GST @ 4 days.


Regards,

XIONG

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.


Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

Email: claims@rico60.com

On Fri, Aug 6, 2021 at 5:42 PM Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Xiong,
 
Finalize COR $4700 before GST @ 4 days.
COR subject to insurance approval.
 
Regards,
Guo Qiang
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发件人: Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com>

发送时间: 2021年8月4日 22:59
收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>; Rico 60 Enquiry <enquiry@rico60.com>; Hsiao Tong
(LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
<CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
<admin-d@lkkauto.com>

主题: Re: SJR 9162 T TOYOTA ALTIS ------FINALIZE
 
hi guo qiang,



REMINDER  FINALIZE,



Kindly assist us to finalize this case. 
 
Pls check & revert to us soon.
 

pls note u already own me a lot cases
haven't finalize



Regards,

xiong










RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.


Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875
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Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

Email: claims@rico60.com





On Sun, Jul 18, 2021 at 6:23 PM Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> wrote:


HI LKK

REMINDER  FINALIZE,

Kindly assist us to finalize this case ASAP.

Regards,

XIONG

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.


Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

Email: claims@rico60.com

On Fri, Jul 9, 2021 at 8:27 PM Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> wrote:

HI LKK


REMINDER  FINALIZE,


Kindly assist us to finalize this case ASAP.




Regards,

XIONG
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RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.


Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

Email: claims@rico60.com





On Thu, Jun 10, 2021 at 6:44 PM Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> wrote:


HI LKK,

REMINDER  FINALIZE,

Kindly assist us to finalize this case ASAP.


Regards,

XIONG

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.


Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

Email: claims@rico60.com

On Fri, Jun 4, 2021 at 12:04 PM Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> wrote:

hi guo qiang,
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Reminder finalize 1



Regards,

xiong







RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.


Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

Email: claims@rico60.com





On Sat, May 15, 2021 at 8:46 AM Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> wrote:


HI LKK ,

URGENT FINALIZE    


Kindly assist us to finalize this case.

Pls check & revert to us soon.

Regards,

XIONG

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.


Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
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#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

Email: claims@rico60.com

On Sat, Apr 17, 2021 at 9:09 AM Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> wrote:

hi guo qiang,


HI Chee,


Reminder finalize



Regards,

xiong




RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.


Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

Email: claims@rico60.com





On Fri, Mar 12, 2021 at 2:13 PM Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> wrote:


hi Guo Qiang,

REMINDER FINALIZE 

Regards,xiong
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RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.


Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

Email: claims@rico60.com

On Wed, Mar 3, 2021 at 9:03 AM Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> wrote:

Guo Qiang


Attached is the  after paint for your reference.


Kindly assist us to finalize this case.


Pls check & revert to us soon.




Regards,xiong










RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.


Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

Email: claims@rico60.com
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