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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 February 2021 2:34 PM

To: SUR; assignments

Cc: Nivitha (LKK Auto); Hansel Ang; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10009092/CH || OI- SJQ1156U (Silver) TP-JUG9387 || 

Est:0.00 || S Three Automotive

Attachments: IMG_20210216_133255_resized_20210216_013541623.jpg; IMG_20210216_133308

_resized_20210216_013541992.jpg; IMG_20210216_133321_resized_20210216_

013542298.jpg

Hi LKK Team, 

 

Kindly appoint Mr. Kenneth Kong for TP Survey for vehicle JUG9387. 

 

Workshop: 

S Three Automotive Recovery Pte Ltd 

Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate 

#01-64/66 Singapore – 575643 

Tel: 65-6284 1542 / 65-6284 1575 

Fax: 65-6487 5315 

 

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 
 

Stanley Lai 

Executive, Claims 

  

T +65 6540 2189 

F +65 6725 0853  

E stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg 

   

  

 

Customer Care +65 6221 2111 

Claims +65 6221 2199 

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 

 

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 

Singapore Shopping Centre 

Singapore 

239924                                                                                                                                  

budgetdirect.com.sg 

 

 
 

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget 

Direct Insurance. 
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From: Ganesh <executive@johnlawchambers.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 16 February 2021 1:57 pm 

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Cc: Hansel Ang <hansel.ang@budgetdirect.com.sg>; admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg; 

admin@johnlawchambers.com 

Subject: RE: PRI - OUR VEH: JUG9387 / OUR REF: JLC.1843.2021.PD(G) / Our ref: C10009092/CH 

 

 
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
Herewith attached our client’s police report for your perusal. 
 
Thank you. 
 
With Regards, 

GANESH.VGANESH.VGANESH.VGANESH.V    

JOHN LAW CHAMBERS LLC 

151 Chin Swee Road 

#10-07 Manhattan House 

Singapore 169876. 

TEL: 65926983 / 65926984 

DID: 88201591 

FAX: 65926985 

 

 
  
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: 
This email from JOHN LAW CHAMBERS LLC (including any attachment to it) is confidential and may also be 
privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. Accordingly, if you are not the intended recipient please 
notify us immediately, delete this e-mail (including any attachment to it) from your computer system and do not 
disclose or distribute it to any other person or continue to read this e-mail. Thank you. 
 

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 16 February 2021 1:34 pm 

To: S Three Automotive <admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg>; Ganesh <executive@johnlawchambers.com> 

Cc: admin@johnlawchambers.com; Hansel Ang <hansel.ang@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: PRI - OUR VEH: JUG9387 / OUR REF: JLC.1843.2021.PD(G) / Our ref: C10009092/CH 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Yan Zhen, 

 

Kindly let us have your client’s accident report as well. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 
 

Stanley Lai 

Executive, Claims 



3

  

T +65 6540 2189 

F +65 6725 0853  

E stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg 

   

  

 

Customer Care +65 6221 2111 

Claims +65 6221 2199 

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 

 

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 

Singapore Shopping Centre 

Singapore 

239924                                                                                                                                  

budgetdirect.com.sg 

 

 
 

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget 

Direct Insurance. 

 

 

 

From: S Three Automotive <admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 16 February 2021 1:23 pm 

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Ganesh <executive@johnlawchambers.com> 

Cc: admin@johnlawchambers.com 

Subject: RE: PRI - OUR VEH: JUG9387 / OUR REF: JLC.1843.2021.PD(G) / Our ref: C10009092/CH 

 

Hi  

 

We prefer Mr. Kenneth Kong   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thanks & Regards  

 

Yan Zhen  

 
S Three Automotive Recovery Pte Ltd 

Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate 

#01-64/66 Singapore – 575643 

Tel: 65-6284 1542 / 65-6284 1575 

Fax: 65-6487 5315 

Email: admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg 



4

FaceBook: https://m.facebook.com/starcarleasingPL 

 

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 16 February 2021 10:00 AM 

To: Ganesh <executive@johnlawchambers.com>; Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Cc: S Three Automotive <admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg>; admin@johnlawchambers.com 

Subject: RE: PRI - OUR VEH: JUG9387 / OUR REF: JLC.1843.2021.PD(G) / Our ref: C10009092/CH 

 

Without Prejudice  

 

Dear Sirs, 

  

Please find the list of our proposed surveyors.  

  

Mr. William Ng   (A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Xing Guo Qiang   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Mohammed Rasul   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Mohamad Taufihk   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Adrian Ling   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Marcus Chua   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Kenneth Kong   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Pang Kiah Keen (Frankie)   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Chua Soo Teck (Benjamin)   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Ng You Han   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Soon HanXin (Gary)   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Chow Bo Xiong   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Derrick Quok – our in house surveyor 

Mr. Kenneth Lim – our in house surveyor 

 

Thank you, 

-Julie 

 

From: Ganesh <executive@johnlawchambers.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 16 February 2021 9:29 am 

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Cc: admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg; admin@johnlawchambers.com 

Subject: PRI - OUR VEH: JUG9387 / OUR REF: JLC.1843.2021.PD(G) / 

 

OUR REF: JLC.1843.2021.PD(G) 

YR REF: TO BE ADVISED 

OUR VEH: JUG9387 

YR VEH: SJQ1156U 

DOA: 11.02.2021 

LOC: HOUGANG STREET 91 

 
…………………………………………………………………………………………………………………….. 
 
15.02.2021 
                                                                                           
AUTO & GENERAL INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD                                              BY EMAIL  

SINGAPORE SHOPPING CENTRE 

190 CLEMENCEAU AVENUE #03-01 

SINGAPORE 239924. 

 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES JUG9387 AND SJQ1156U ALONG HOUGANG STREET 91 ON 
11.02.2021. 
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Dear Sir/Madam,      
 
We act for the owner of the vehicle no. JUG9387. 

Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

We are instructed to claim damages against you in connection with the above accident. 
 
Pursuant to NIMA protocol, we hereby give you notice to conduct a pre-repair inspection of our client’s motor vehicle 
at the under-stated workshop:- 
 

S THREE AUTOMOTIVE RECOVERY PTE LTD 

BLK 8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE 

#01-64/66 SINGAPORE – 575643 

TEL: 65-6284 1542 / 65-6284 1575 

FAX: 65-6487 5315 

EMAIL: ADMIN@STHREEAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG 

 
 
TAKE NOTICE that you are required to respond to us within 2 working days (excluding Saturday, Sunday and Public 
Holiday) of receipt of this notice as to whether you wish to carry out or waive a pre-repair inspection. If we do not hear 
from you in this regard by the stipulated time, we shall construe your silence as a waiver of the requirement for a pre-
repair inspection and our client’s repairers shall proceed to repair our client’s vehicle. 
Please contact us at 6592 6983 or email us at executive@johnlawchambers.com  / 
admin@johnlawchambers.com   for future correspondences. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
With Regards, 

GANESH.VGANESH.VGANESH.VGANESH.V    

JOHN LAW CHAMBERS LLC 

151 Chin Swee Road 

#10-07 Manhattan House 

Singapore 169876. 

TEL: 65926983 / 65926984 

DID: 88201591 

FAX: 65926985 

 

 
  
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: 
This email from JOHN LAW CHAMBERS LLC (including any attachment to it) is confidential and may also be 
privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. Accordingly, if you are not the intended recipient please 
notify us immediately, delete this e-mail (including any attachment to it) from your computer system and do not 
disclose or distribute it to any other person or continue to read this e-mail. Thank you. 

 

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited, 

Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. 

The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect 

views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the 

intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure 

of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then 

delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.  

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited, 

Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. 

The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect 
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views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the 

intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure 

of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then 

delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.  

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited, 

Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. 

The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect 

views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the 

intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure 

of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then 

delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.  


