Our Ref: 20/0058/TP
Vehicle No: XD 4475 G

Allied

Aute Appraisal

ANNEX
REPAIR DETAILS (XD 4475G)
Recommended Parts o
il ' i _ o 2 Repairer's  Adjuster's
No Qty Partucylgtrs bl W Cg?gl_tzlqn. i Emount e Amdunt
1 1 Headlamp Assembly le Casing Broken 971.007 {79.72971.00 ~
2 1 Front Side & Signal Lamp - N/s Cracked/Broken 674.00/  674.00 574~
3 1 Headlamp Top Garnish - N/s Grazed - To Re-paint NN 1,120.00 0.00
4 1 Front Side Bumper - N/s Dented/Cracked 1,719.00 7% 1,719.00 [S\C\ .
5 1 2" Step Board - N/s Grazed - To Re-paint NN  2,025.00 0.00
6 1 2™ Step Board Garnish - N/s Holder Broken 1,184.00 1,184.00 ~
Fé 1 2" Step Board Garnish Reflector Grazed 32.00 32.00 -~
- N/s
8 1 1%t Step Plate Panel - N/s Cracked/Broken 356.00 356.00 Q.7L|. P
9 1 Front Wheel Front Mudguard - N/s ~ Grazed - To Re-paint NN__ 679.70 ~_0.00
Sub-Total 8,760.70  4,936.00
Less 0% 0.00 0.00
Total Parts (S$) 8,760.70 4,936.00
Recommended Labours
Repalrer‘s‘  Adjuster's
i e e ‘ b - _Amount  Amount
1 To repalr Ieft headlamp top garmsh left 2 step board and left 900.00 600.00 4(C
front wheel front mudguard including replacement of the left
front accident damaged parts.
2  To check front lightings and electrical wiring system include 80.00 50.00 '30
focusing both headlights and adjust if necessary.
3  To putty and re-spray painting on left headlamp top garnish, left 1.155.00 1,050.00 500
front side bumper, left 2% step board, left 2™ step board garnish
and left front wheel front mudguard. . .
Total Labour (S$)  2,135.00 _ 1,700.00
Total Repair Cost (S$) 10,895.70 6,636.00
| Adjusted Repair Cost (Part by Part basis) 5$6,636.00 |
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Qur Ref’ 20/0058/1°P
Vehicle No: XD 4475 G

Allied

Auto Appraisal

ANNEX
REPAIR DETAILS (XD 4475 G)
Recommended Parts = - e |
No- Quy Particulars Candtion S RBeRS e aeetes;
1 1 Headlamp Assembly - W/ signal Casing Broken 971.00 411 _ ESOBBO- {77.>
2 1 Front Side & Signal Lamp - N/s Cracked/Broken 674.00 574
3 1 Headlamp Top Garnish - N/s Grazed - To Re-paint 1,120.00
4 1 Front Side Bumper - N/s Dented/Cracked 1,719.00 (¥iq 4652150) |
5 1 2™ Step Board - N/s Grazed - To Re-paint 2,025.00
6 1 27 Step Board Garnish - N/s Holder Broken 1,184.00 [\ XHBHBO 12.94.5¢
T 1 2 Step Board Garnish Reflector Grazed 32.00 3> Xx 32100
-N/s

8 1 1 Step Plate Panel - N/s Cracked/Broken 356.00 »1Y X@56.000 T04 2
9 1 Front Wheel Front Mudguard - N/s  Grazed - To Re-paint 679.70 e

Sub-Total 8,760.70

Less 0% 0.00 et

Total Parts (S$) 8760070 »

Recommended Labours. I R
: B e TR e D ki Repairer'st i Ad]uster’s:
A eaiBesbasAmount: <= Amount

No' Pafticutars

1 To repair left headlamp top garnish, left 2™ step board and left 900.00 400.00
front wheel front mudguard including replacement of the left
front accident damaged parts.
2 To check front lightings and electrical wiring system include 80.00 30.00
focusing both headlights and adjust if necessary.
3 1o putty and re-spray painting on left headlamp top garnish, left 1,155.00 600.00

front side bumper, left 2™ step board, left 2™ step board garnish
and left front wheel front mudguard. —

Total Labour (S$) 2,135.00 saos e

Total Repair Cost (S$) 10,895.70

Adjusted Repair Cost (Part by Part basis ) . ]
ok
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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Goh, Jeremy <Jeremy.Goh@aig.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 12:56 PM XLEP4X2000 523 ¥4
To: Reports (LKKAuto)
Ca SUR; Huey Yon (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: <Evaluation Report>Your Ref : 0538307605SG *Our Ref:
CS3/AIG20011996/Eqd3e2-1 ‘,
el V_f' |
« (t.f() N 20
Hi Elaine, &
Thanks for the report. Can I check with you on the survey report parts. . :
N e
I make reference to this below. 7“" ’ ;
1|HEADLAMP ASSEMBLY-N/S Y24-70  |casinG BROKEN 971.00 omoo] -9 LT |58
1|FRONT SIDE & SIGNAL LAMP-N/S 1y |[crAckeD! 674.00 574.00 h o
BROKEN 7%

I checked with my In house surveyor. They shared that this item is supposed to be 1 item instead of 2.
And also it has been inflated by the TPWS. Can confirm?

Hope to hear from you soon.

Regards

Jeremy Goh

Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AlG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1767
Jeremy.goh®@aig.com | www.AIG.com.sg

If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, 1 do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you.

From: Elaine (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com> = 7 ) e
Sent: Thursday, March 4, 2021 5:02 PM LS| 418! an gty D
To: Goh, Jeremy <Jeremy.Goh@aig.com>

Cec: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)' <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] <Evaluation Report>Your Ref : 0538307605SG *Our Ref:
CS3/A1G20011996/Eqd3e2-1

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Your Ref : 0538307605SG
Our Ref : CS3/A1G20011996/Eqd3e2-1

Dear Jeremy,
We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed herewith the evaluation report and our note of charge for your necessary action.
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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

s vk
From: Ng Alex <Alex.Ng@scania.com>
Sent: Monday, 22 March 2021 2:16 PM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: KINDLY ASSIST TO CHECK THE PARTS PRICES OF SCANIA P380CA4X2MSZ

HI Shiau Chan,

Please find the Prices.

Kindly assist to check the parts prices of SCANIA P380CA4X2MSZ, chassis no.: XLEP4X20005237724
1. FRONT SIDE BUMPER — N/S-S 741.00
2. 2N° STEP BOARD GARNISH — N/S - $ 1299.50
3. 15TSTEP PLATE PANEL—N/S - $ 509.79

Best Regards.
Alex Ng

Parts | Scania Singapore

Phone: +65 68619181 ext 205 ; Fax: +65 6861 1650

Address: 40, Senoko Road, Singapore 758112 alex.ng@scania.com
www.scania.com.sg | www.facebook.com/scaniagroup

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 March 2021 2:10 PM

To: Ng Alex <Alex.Ng@scania.com>

Subject: KINDLY ASSIST TO CHECK THE PARTS PRICES OF SCANIA P380CA4X2MSZ

Dear Alex,
As spoken with you.

Kindly assist to check the parts prices of SCANIA P380CA4X2MSZ, chassis no.: XLEP4X20005237724
1. FRONT SIDE BUMPER — N/S
2. 2"°STEP BOARD GARNISH — N/S
3. 15TSTEP PLATE PANEL - N/S

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



