Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Zhe Hao Lau <jasonlauzh@lioncityrentals.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 5 May, 2021 9:00 AM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Cc: Siak Tong Sim

Subject: Fwd: Vehicle SLD6051A, finalize repair costs
Attachments: SLD 6051A FINAL.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Green category

Dear Sun Pin,

This vehicle SLD6051A, we will accept the offer of repair costs at $4950.00 lump sum with 5 working
days.

Thank you.

Regards,

Jason

ARC Executive

6955 9331

60 Jalan Lam Huat,
#04-39/40 Carros Centre

Singapore 737869

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com>
Date: Tue, Apr 20, 2021 at 3:09 PM

Subject: RE: Vehicle SLD6051A, finalize repair costs
To: Zhe Hao Lau <jasonlauzh @lioncityrentals.com.sg>
Cc: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong @lioncityrentals.com.sg>

Hi Jason,

Kindly refer the finalize amount $4,950. Repair day 5 days. (L/S, before gst).

Please confirm the COR by reply email.



