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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 9 February 2021 4:32 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments

Cc: Stanley Lai; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C20009021/ST || OI-FBQ6894J (White) TP- SLL6691U || Est: $ 

|| Yi Heng Motor Workshop

Attachments: Pre repair notice.pdf

Hi Team, 

 

We would like to request TP survey for SLL6691U.  We don’t have a copy for both reports yet.  TP vehicle is in. 

 

Workshop information:  

Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-57 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit, S (417883) 

 

Please confirm.   Thank you.  

 

 

Regards, 

 

 

Ivy Ratilla 

Executive, Claims Admin 

 

T +65 6540 2185 

F +65 6725 0853   

E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg  
 

 
 

Customer Care +65 6221 2111 

Claims +65 6221 2199 

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 

 

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 

Singapore Shopping Centre 

Singapore 

239924                                                                                                                                  

budgetdirect.com.sg 

 

 
 

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget 

Direct Insurance. 

 

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & 

General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) 

reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is 

confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, 



2

confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this 

email is unauthorised.  

 

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is 

for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the 

stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may 

be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, 

interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.  

 

From: YI HENG MOTOR WORKSHOP <yihengmotorworkshop@yahoo.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 9 February 2021 4:02 PM 

To: Linda Phua <linda@lindaphualaw.com>; Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Ivy Ratilla 

<ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: ACC INV SLL 6991U AND FBQ 6894J ON THE 08.02.21 AT STANLEY STREET 

 

Good afternoon, 
 
We choose Mr. Mohamad Rasul  (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 
 
remarks : please be informed that vehicle SLL 6691U currently at our workshop at Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-57 
Autobay @ Kaki Bukit, S (417883) 
 
 
Thank you, 
 
Regards, 
Jason 
 
On Tuesday, 9 February 2021, 12:48:52 pm SGT, Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg> wrote:  

From: Linda Phua <linda@lindaphualaw.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 9 February 2021 11:05 AM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Cc: yihengmotorworkshop@yahoo.com.sg 
Subject: ACC INV SLL 6991U AND FBQ 6894J ON THE 08.02.21 AT STANLEY STREET  

  

Dear Sir  

  

1. We act for BKW Rent A Car Pte Ltd, whose vehicle SLL 6991 U was damaged as a result of the 
abovementioned accident.  

  

2. Attached is a copy of our Notice of Accident and an invitation for arrangement of pre repair inspection within 
the NIMA protocol period.  

  

3. Please respond accordingly. Do note that we have copied this email directly to the workshop, Yi Heng Motor 
Workshop. Please request that your surveyor , if you wish to conduct PRI to contact Mr Jason Chin for 
arrangement of PRI.  
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Regards 

Linda Phua 

  

                                              

  

  

  

LINDA PHUA LAW PRACTICE 

COMMISSIONER FOR OATHS  

E: linda@lindaphualaw.com 

T: +65 6534 7388    F: +65  6534 8911   M: 9777 2781 

20 Havelock Road, Central Square #02-45 Singapore 059765 

  

Website: www.lindaphualaw.com 

  

  

LINDA PHUA LAW PRACTICE (UEN 53313522B) DO NOT ACCEPT SERVICE OF COURT DOCUMENTS OR 
NOTICE OF ANY PROCEEDINGS BY FAX OR EMAIL. 

  

This document is confidential and privileged. If you have received this transmission in error, please notify the 
sender immediately by reply e-mail and then delete this message. You should not copy or use it for any 
purpose or disclose its contents to any other person. 

  

  

  

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. 
Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended 
addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may 
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not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are 
not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or 
disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender 
and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.  

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited, 

Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. 

The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect 

views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the 

intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure 

of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then 

delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.  


