5/13/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: LOD - SJG 135 P // LKK Ref: CC4/ASM21001859/Upa3

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Thu 13/5/2021 12:53 PM

To: Nineteen Autowerks <nineteenautowerks@gmail.com>

mj 1 attachments (496 KB)
DS FORM_SJG135P.pdf;

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nineteen Autowerks <nineteenautowerks@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 11 May 2021 12:30 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LOD - SJG 135 P // LKK Ref: CC4/ASM21001859/Upa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We accept offer as follows.

Thank you.

On Tue, 11 May 2021 at 12:25 PM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to your below email.
We have our principal instruction to improve our offer at a global sum of $10,600.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of

liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Nineteen Autowerks <nineteenautowerks@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 April 2021 3:59 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LOD - SJG 135 P // LKK Ref: CC4/ASM21001859/Upa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
We can't accept all-in at $10,000.00.

Vehicle repair costs given by the surveyor was $10,500.00.
On top of that, there was also a rental invoice, LTA Search fee and Towing fee.

The police investigation letter also shows that our client was not at fault.

Best Regards,
Vessie Foo

Nineteen Autowerks Pte Ltd Blk 13 Kaki Bukit Road 4, #01-05, Bartley Biz Centre, Singapore 417807 | T:
+65 9674 1991 | E: Nineteenautowerks@gmail.com | Co. Reg. No. 201922431M

WARNING: The information contained in this email (including any attachment) is intended only
for the attention of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please permanently delete the original,
destroy all copies and inform the sender by return email. Thank you.
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On Tue, 27 Apr 2021 at 15:49, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $10,000.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with
the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No
admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Nineteen Autowerks <nineteenautowerks@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 8 March 2021 5:19 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: LOD - SJG 135 P

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Enclosed LOD documents for your reference.
Would you need the hard copy? Thank you.
Best regards,

Vessie Foo

Nineteen Autowerks Pte Ltd

Tel: (65) 9674 1991
Email: nineteenautowerks@gmail.com
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Best Regards,
Vessie Foo

Nineteen Autowerks Pte Ltd Blk 13 Kaki Bukit Road 4, #01-05, Bartley Biz Centre, Singapore 417807 | T:
+65 9674 1991 | E: Nineteenautowerks@gmail.com | Co. Reg. No. 201922431M

WARNING: The information contained in this email (including any attachment) is intended only for
the attention of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information.

If you are not the intended recipient, please permanently delete the original, destroy all copies and
inform the sender by return email. Thank you.
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